
By: Amel Al-Ariqi

and Mohammed bin Salam 

SANA’A, Oct. 7 — The current situa-
tion in Yemen has worried many Arab 
countries, which warn that the Houthi 
rebellion in northern Yemen and seces-
sionist unrest in southern Yemen could 
potentially destabilize the Middle East 
region. 

The Secretary-General of the Arab 
League, Amr Moussa said on Tuesday 
that Arab states supported the unity of 
Yemen. 

“(The Arab League) affirms its sup-
port for Yemen’s unity, security and 
stability,” Moussa told reporters after 
meeting Yemeni President Ali Abdullah 
Saleh. 

He declined to say if the Arab 
League would attempt to mediate in 
either of the two conflicts. However, 
he said, “Any initiative or proposal 
must serve stability and unity... 
Comprehensive national dialogue is 
the way.” 

“The president has expressed open-
ness in engaging in dialogue with the 
different political sides inside Yemen 
and abroad, no matter what the differ-
ences are, and he expressed his readi-
ness to hold talks with them” he added, 
confirming that the unity of Yemen 
does not concern only Yemenis but all 
Arabs.

Coinciding with the visit of Moussa 
Thousands, of people rallied on 

Tuesday the streets of southern Yemen 
to demand the restoration of the 
region’s independence.

Witnesses said more than 10,000 
demonstrators marched in the city of 
Dhal’e, while thousands more turned 
out in various centers in the Lahj and 
Abyan provinces.

Protesters brandished the flag of the 
former independent state and chanted 
anti-government slogans

The Protesters also held up banners 
calling for Arab states to protect the 
south, a formerly independent state 
that was united with northern Yemen 
in 1990.

Shi’ite threat

Ahmed Abu Al-Gheit, the Egyptian 
foreign minister warned last week that 
“foreign hands” were stirring trouble 
in Yemen, in a reference to Iran’s 
alleged support for northern rebels 
Al-Houthis.

Houthis and Iran deny Yemeni gov-
ernment statements that the northern 
insurgents want to set up a Shi’ite state 
in north Yemen. The Houthi leader, 
Abdul-Malik al-Houthi described the 
conflict as a fight for rights against 
unfair rule, while Iran said it has 
always emphasized the sovereignty, 
independence and national unity of 
Yemen. 

However Iran urged Yemen to end 
the conflict peacefully.

However, several Arab countries, 

including Egypt and Saudi Arabia, are 
concerned over what they see as efforts 
by Shi’ite Muslim Iran to extend its 
influence by supporting Houthis group. 
“We are refusing any foreign interfer-
ence or rebellion,” said Abu Al-Gheit.

Military actions 

Yemeni defense ministry Web site 
announced that Yemeni military police 
seized five trucks on Tuesday, loaded 
with large quantity of explosives, oil 
and gas cylinders in al-Hanasat point, 
al-Jawf province.

The trucks were seized while on 
their way to the rebels in Sa’ada.

The Web site said that the trucks 
were carrying 350 bags of powder, 200 
plastic bottles filled with fuel and die-
sel, over 200 gas cylinders and quanti-
ties of medications including narcotic 
pills were hidden under cargo of fruits 
and vegetables. 

Twelve rebels were killed in clashes 
took place in Harf Sufyan and four 
others were killed while trying to dig 
trenches in Al-Abarat east of 
Al-Maqash. Additionally, 8 rebels 
were killed in the past two days in al-
Malahidh, according to the govern-
ment.

In related news, the Yemen Times 
got information affirmed that a MEG-
21 crashed and its pilot, a 1st lieuten-
ant, died at Saqin to the northwest of 
Sa’ada last Friday. Another jet fighter, 
a Sukhoi M-22, also crashed Monday 
night at Al-Anad in Sa’ada, but there 
was no news of the fate its pilot, who 
was a colonel.

The Ministry of Defense Web site 
confirmed the incidents, but attributed 
them to technical breakdowns. The 
Web site said nothing about what hap-
pened to the pilots.  

An Houthi media source told the 
press that they had shot down the two 
fighters planes using 23mm anti-air-
craft machine guns on the area where 

the government and Houthis have been 
fighting since August 11. Al-Houthis 
showed the identity card of the MEG-
21 pilot. 

The Ministry of Defense said that 
government forces are about to finish 
the war in its favor. 

The Houthis, on the other hand, said 
that are controlling over 75 percent of 
Sa’ada’s 14 districts, in addition to the 
Harf Sufian district in Amran. 

Well-informed sources asserted that 
over 3,000 have been killed and 
injured. 

Humanitarian calls continue  

Human Rights Watch asked, in a state-
ment last Monday, authorities to allow 
humanitarian organizations to help 
about 180,000 civilian caught in the 
fighting zone.  

The same statement said that John 
Holmes, the UN Humanitarian Aid 

Coordinator had realized during his 
September 7-8 visit to Yemen that he 
could play a significant role in draw-
ing the world attention to serious 
effects of the clash between the army 
and the Houthis in Sa’ada and Harf 
Sufian. 

HRW called upon donors to responds 
generously to the UN request for the 
provision of $23.7 million to help peo-
ple affected by the conflict. According 
to the organization’s Web site, only 
three million have been donated so 
far. 

It renewed its request for Saudi 
Arabia to stop returning refugees flee-
ing fighting to conflict areas because it 
is a violation of the international ban 
on coercive repatriation of people to a 
place where their lives or freedoms are 
in danger.

Some civilians said they had to walk 
for days in mountainous, deserted 
areas to reach safety because many 
paths were blocked by militants or by 

fighting.
HRW said neither the government, 

nor the Houthis have responded to the 
UN calls for the opening of humani-
tarian passageways to help those peo-
ple.

The organization said it had had 
asked Holmes to talk authorities into 
facilitating provision of relief to the 
civilians who are badly in need for 
food, water, shelter and health care.  

“Fighting and government restric-
tions means tens of thousands of civil-
ians in northern Yemen are cut off 
from help that they desperately need,” 
said Joe Stork, deputy Middle East 
director at HRW. “The government 
needs to help aid agencies reach civil-
ians, not throw up obstacles in their 
way.”

Syaj for Childhood Protection 
appealed to the governments of Yemen 
and Saudi Arabia to save the lives of 
120 children caught with their families 
in a mosque at Aleb Checkpoint on the 
borders since mid September 2009. 

Syaj’s call came in response to an 
urgent call by relatives of the over 70 
distressed families. Syaj volunteers in 
the north of Sa’ada confirmed the 
news. The organization requests the 
government to set off a diplomatic ini-
tiative, and asks that Saudi authorities 
allow those families to join their rela-
tives in Saudi Arabia, especially those 
who have Saudi citizenship. 

Syaj said it asked the Saudi govern-
ment to do that out of humane duty, 
and what religions and humanitarian 
conventions call for to help the people 
who had been driven out of their dev-
astated towns and villages, and who 
cannot go back due to fighting.
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 By: Mahmoud Assamiee 
  
SANA’A, Oct. 4 _ Contradicting news 
has been reported about technical 
problems at the Mareb Power Station 
(Mareb 1) which have caused the 
repeated power blackouts in many 
Yemeni governorates.

There is technical problem concern-
ing the gas which will be used as fuel 
for the station, said Spokesman of 
Ministry of Electricity and Energy 
Muhareb Abu Ghanem. 

He explained that there are differ-
ence between German Siemens 

Company, which constructed the sta-
tion, and the Safer Company for Oil 
and Gas (the company that provided 
Siemens the sample of gas to be used 
as fuel for the station). Now after con-
structing the station, a technical prob-
lem with gas has been found.

The gas is not suitable to be used as 
fuel for the station. He said, now each 
company blames each other. Siemens 
said the gas is not up to standards put 
by them for operating the station but 
Safer says there is no problem with 
gas and it is the samples it gave to 
Siemens before constructing the sta-

tion.
But Minister of Electricity and 

Energy, Awadh Assuqatri, explained 
the problem in different way, saying 
the gas which will be used as a fuel 
contains great percentage of diesel. 

“The trial operation of Mareb 1 was 
stopped yesterday upon information of 
quantities of diesel substances included 
in gas,” he said. It is supposed that the 
station should be constructed to use 
any kind of gas because “the gas is the 
gas.” 

 He said the General Electric 
Corporation talked about this issue 

with the Safer Company, which replied 
that there was no problem and present-
ed the same samples of these gas sub-
stances to German company. 

  The minister said this problem will 
be solved. 

  Electric engineers say the problem 
is in the electrical infrastructure and 
that the new station’s output is too 
strong, and can cause damages to 
household appliances, and that trans-
former stations need to be re-qualified. 

  “There is no problem in transform-
er stations and the problem lies in the 
generating station,” said a source in 

the Transforming Stations and Transmit 
Project, who asked to remain anony-
mous because he isn’t authorized to 
talk to media.  

 He said that that they have conduct-
ed trail operations in these stations and 
do not face problems.  

  “Currently, we are conducting con-
verse electricity feeding from Sana’a 
to the Mareb governorate and there is 
no problem in this process,” he said. 

  On the other hand, the Ministry of 
Electricity and Energy saw bids on 
Saturday for the second and third 
phase of the construction of Mareb 2 

and Mareb 3. The ministry is currently 
studying the proposals. 

  Russian Techno Prom Company 
bid USD 480 million and Indian 
Buharat Company bid USD 478.3 mil-
lion for constructing Mareb 2. The 
ministry said the station would cost 
USD 300 million, and put out 400 
megawatts of power. 

  The Techno Prom Company bid 
USD 316 million for constructing 
Mareb 3 with an output of 300 mega-
watts, and Indian Buharat Company 
bid USD 369 million. 

 The ministry said Mareb 3 should 

Contradicting news over delay operating Mareb 1

By: Ali Saeed

SANA’A, Oct. 7 _ After around eight 
years working on dubas research, a 
Yemeni entomologist, Dr. Mohamed 
Ali Hubaishan, an agricultural 
researcher, was able to discover a nat-
ural way to eradicate the dubas pest 
that can damage date palms.

“Instead of using chemical substanc-
es that have negative side effects to 
human and environment, the new para-
site that we have found out would be 
useful and environment-friendly,” said 
Hubaishan.

“While we were studying the date 
palm pest in 2005, we discovered a 
new parasite that makes holes in the 
dubas eggs and prevents them from 
hatching, which reduces the population 
of the dubas,” said Hubaishan.

“We took samples of the parasite to 
France in 2008 to laboratories to 
observe it more and we found that the 
parasite is a biological control against 
dubas bug and has no side effects,” 
explained Hubaishan.

“It only kills the dubas,” he said.
“The new parasite was also found in 

Oman and Iraq where the dubas is 
common,” according to the researcher.

“The dubas is really damaging the 
palm trees in the governorates of 
Hadhramout, Shabwa, and Al-Mahra, 
making big losses for farmers there, 
and affecting their livelihoods, so we 
have to make use of the new discov-
ered parasite to biologically control the 
heavy infestation in the affected areas,” 

said Hubaishan. 
“I also heard from my colleagues 

that the dubas has moved to Lahj gov-
ernorate and it also may spread to 
Tehama region,” he added.

“So the best technique to stop the 
infestation in the country is to rear mil-
lions of the new discovered parasite 
and then release it to dubas areas to 
biologically control the pests,” he said, 
adding that this was his recommenda-
tion to the Ministry of Agriculture.

“The ministry of agriculture has to 
benefit from the new parasite to con-
trol the infestation instead of using 
chemical substances and spending a lot 
of money every year,” suggested the 
researcher.

“We share information with our col-
leagues in Oman, but there is no big 
cooperation between us, but I’m trying 
to introduce the project of rearing the 
new parasite to them to be implement-
ed in both countries; Oman and 
Yemen,” said the researcher.

 According to the researcher, it is 
difficult to figure out how many peo-
ple in Hadhramout, Shabwa, and 
Al-Mahra depend on dates crops for 
their income.

“It is also even difficult to estimate 
the extension of the damage caused by 
the dubas,” he said, “since the effect of 
the damage does not appear in the 
same year. It just emerges the next 
year after the infestation,” 

Yemeni researcher discovers new 
biological method to fight palms’ pest

By Truls Brekke 

Ghonia Jaber cries and wriggles in the 
doctor’s lap as he takes her measure-
ments to determine whether the 
14-month-old is malnourished. 

She is just one of the children 
UNICEF has screened for malnutrition 
in the Al-Mazrak camp for people dis-
placed by conflict in northern Yemen. 
The camp is located some 40 km from 
the town of Harad in the deserts of 
western Yemen. 

Living conditions here are tough. 
All 12 members of Ghonia’s family 
live under one tent. But it’s better than 
the situation back in their remote 
mountain village in Sa’ada province, 
where fighting is still raging. When the 
conflict reached their village, Ghonia’s 
family walked for four days before 
they reached the camp, exhausted from 
the effort.

Fighting in the north of the country, 
pitting government troops against 
Houthi rebel forces, has forced 150,000 
people to flee. The crisis is taking an 
especially heavy toll on children. Since 
the conflict intensified in August, cases 
of severe malnutrition have increased 
threefold. 

Children under five at risk 
The results of the nutrition screening 
in Al-Mazrak are stark. One in five 
children under five years of age suffers 
from acute malnutrition, with about 
half of the cases considered severe. 

In Ghonia’s family alone, seven out 
of the nine children are acutely mal-
nourished, and five of the cases are 
severe.

“The situation is very serious. If not 
treated, these children are at a high 
risk of death,” says UNICEF Yemen’s 
Chief of Young Child Survival and 
Development, Dr. Kamel Ben 

Abdallah. He adds that malnutrition 
accounts for 60 percent of deaths 
among the under-five population. 
Malaria is also a threat as the rainy 
season begins, and malnourished chil-
dren are at increased risk of disease. 

Therapeutic food
As families arrive at the camp, mal-
nourished children receive special 
treatment. Severely affected children 
get Plumpy’nut, a ready-to-use thera-
peutic food that provides the calories, 
nourishment, vitamins and protein they 
need in order to recuperate. 

As of late September, UNICEF-
trained health workers had distributed 
24,000 packets of Plumpy’nut in 
Al-Mazrak – enough to provide for 
160 children for two months. “But the 
number of children in the camp is ris-
ing, so we need to bring in more sup-
plies,” says Dr. Kamel. 

Since the children are in a very weak 
state, they are especially vulnerable to 
infectious diseases and illnesses such 
as measles, malaria and diarrhoea. 
UNICEF, therefore, is also focusing on 
safe drinking water, sanitation and 
hygiene – as well as nutrition – to pre-
vent any disease outbreaks among the 
5,000 people in the camp.

To improve the situation, UNICEF 
is setting up more facilities for chil-
dren in Al-Mazrak, even as it contin-
ues nutrition screening by community 
volunteers who have been recruited 
from the displaced population. 
Meanwhile, the camp’s out-patient 
therapeutic programme is also focus-
ing on children’s long-term nutrition 
needs, with an emphasis on breastfeed-
ing, appropriate complimentary feed-
ing and dietary requirements.

Source : UNICEF 

Treating malnutrition among 
displaced children in Yemen

By: Mahmoud Assamiee

SANA’A, Oct 07- The Ministry of 
Agriculture and Irrigation has 
launched a campaign to measure the 
effects of pesticides in vegetables, 
fruits and qat.

The month long campaign aims at 
discovering and measuring the 
percentage of the pesticides that 
have been sprayed on the crops, via 
new portable measuring appliances 

The campaign also is enlightening 
farmers on health and environmental 
damages caused by pesticides that 
get rid of plant lesions. 

“We started the campaign last 
June in fruits and vegetable markets 
in the capital Sana’a, and then we 
paid field visits to farms of qat and 
grapes,” said the General Manager 
of the Directorate of Plant Protection 
Abdullah Al-Sayani. 

He said that they formed a mobile 
field team in Sana’a checkpoints 
and they are working with their 
appliances. 

The team takes samples from 
vegetables, fruits and qat and 
examines the percentage of 
chemicals included in the plant. 

According to Al-Sayani, the team 
found that there are negative effects 
of chemicals, especially in products 
grown in closed areas like 
greenhouses. 

The results also show that 
cucumbers have the highest percent 

of chemicals because they grows in 
greenhouses and are not exposed to 
the sun, which helps the plants to 
get rid of chemicals. 

But he also said the results show 
chemicals in apples and tomatoes. 

Concerning qat, which people 
think it has the highest quantities of 
chemicals, Al-Sayani said the results 
show that they found lesser 
quantities of chemicals in some 
kinds of qat, and some kinds have 
no chemicals at all.

“This does not mean that many 
quantities of chemicals are not used 
in qat, but sun and waiting for long 
time to harvest helped in getting rid 
of great percent of pesticides,” he 
said. 

He said that open cultivation is 
safer than cultivation in closed areas 
like greenhouses.  

There are 6000 greenhouses in 
Sa’ada alone. 

Concerning measures taken by 
the ministry after finding high 
percentages of chemicals, he said 
there will be cooperation with 
security to stop dangerous products 
from entering markets. 

He also said farmers started 
thinking about efforts to reduce 
chemical use.

“We granted the agricultural 
ministry a complete laboratory to 
analyze the effects of chemicals in 
plants in our efforts to organize 
using chemicals,” said Ahmad 

Al-Aqel, the manager of the 
Croplife Organization in Yemen. 

Croplife is international 
organization working on 
enlightening farmers on the safe use 
of chemicals.

He also said the organization has 
trained a number of agricultural 
cadres abroad for this purpose.  

Al-Sayani said the next step is 
equipping this laboratory to become 
the first one in its kind in the region, 
and training cadres.

According to Croplife, Only 17 
percent of pesticides in Yemeni 
stores are original brands, whereas 
up to 46 percent are fake brands and 
37 percent are banned

Yemen began using pesticides in 
1935 and continued in limited use 
until the early 1950s, when the 
country began using chlorinated 
hydrocarbons to fight locusts, cotton 
blight and palm diseases. Pesticide 
use increased in the 1960s due to 
joint agricultural projects between 
the Agriculture Ministry and 
donors.

Processes involving importing, 
using, selling and storing pesticides 
grew in the 1990s, but with 
complete absence of law to organize 
such processes. 

Therefore, Yemen became an 
open market for various types of 
pesticides, including herbicides (for 
weed control), insecticides and 
fungicides.

Agriculture Ministry measures the 
effects of pesticides on crops

By: Nadia Al-Sakkaf

SANA’A, Oct. 7 _ Twenty-five Yemeni 
businessmen and women gathered for 
two days to strengthen their knowledge 
about corporate governance and how it 
can be used to attract capital and 
improve sustainability. This event was 
organized by the Yemeni Businessmen 
Club in partnership with the 
International Finance Corporation and 
Center for International Private 
Enterprises and Federation of 
Chambers of Commerce and the 
Middle East Partnership Initiative.

The workshop is the second in a 
series of events focusing on develop-
ing practical skills to implement good 
corporate governance for boards of 
directors. The workshop drew active 
participation from leading business-
men representing small, medium, and 
large companies. 

Fathi Abdulwase Hayel secretary 
general of the YBC confirmed that the 
club is about to publish a manual on 
corporate governance and this will be 
available to the business sector in 
Yemen and those interested.

“With the spread of this publication 
and this being the second event the 
YBC is conducting on corporate gov-
ernance we hope that the business sec-
tor becomes more familiar with this 
concept and its application,” he said.

The goal of the workshop was to 
demonstrate to the business communi-
ty that good corporate governance can 
improve performance and sustainabili-
ty and contribute to long-term eco-
nomic growth for the country. The 
program is part of a joint initiative 
between the Center for International 
Private Enterprise (CIPE), the 
International Finance Corporation 
(IFC), the Yemeni Businessmen Club 
(YBC), and the Federation of 

Chambers of Commerce in Yemen.  
Yahya Hakim, a member of the 

board of the Lebanese Transparency 
Society (LTS), and one of the experts 
presenting in the workshop, noted that 
“The high level of interest among 
influential business leaders is a strong 
statement about the need and commit-
ment to improving corporate gover-
nance practices in Yemen.”  

Although this is a relatively new 
concept considering terminology, busi-
nessmen agree that it is applied one 
way or another, especially in larger 
companies. “Although the term is new, 
the concept is not, and many compa-
nies in Yemen do actually apply the 
principles and standards of corporate 
governances relatively. This is why it 
is not seen as a threat to the business 
community, it is rather welcomed,” 
replied Jamal Omar General Manager 
of Universal Hotels.

Abdulhamid Al-Ghazali of 
Al-Ghazali Drugs Company agrees 
with this notion and businesses in gen-
eral are willing to be transparent and 
share information with the media or 
concerned authorities.

“It is a good thing that the corporate 
governance workshop is running 
simultaneously with one for Yemeni 
immigrant businessmen. This is a good 
sign that there is, and will be effort to 
develop the business sector in Yemen,” 
said Dr. Najat Juma’an general man-
ager of Juma’an Company.

In response to questions from jour-
nalists during a press conference on 
the sidelines of the training, business-
men admitted that there had been some 
great losses recently, especially in the 
tourism industry. They said, however, 
the losses are not due to the global 
economic crises. 

Faysal Nasser Al-Zubairy Chairman 

of Arrasheed Modern Schools added, 
“We must not forget that Yemen’s 
economy is quite limited to local 
investments even in the monetary sec-
tor and we don’t have a stock market. 
There are other indirect losses because 
of the fluctuation of oil prices and 
increased expenses of raw materials 
imported from abroad.”

 The two-day workshop addressed 
the role of the board of directors; risk 
management; disclosure and share-
holder relations, and family-owned 
companies and sustainability.  The ses-
sions were facilitated by a team of cor-
porate governance experts representing 
a range of international and regional 
experience, including Yahya Hakim, a 
board member of the Lebanese 
Transparency Society, Khalid Al 
Dhahawi, of the American University 
in Cairo, and Amira El Saeed, the 
Project Officer with the IFC. 

  This workshop is the second in a 
series of workshops being organized 
by the IFC, CIPE and the YBC to pro-
mote corporate governance in Yemen.  
The workshop is also a part of a two-
year initiative between CIPE and YBC 
to improve corporate governance in 
Yemen.    

As part of this initiative, a Task 
Force for Corporate Governance was 
established in February 2008, and it is 
currently developing a set of guide-
lines on corporate governance best 
practices that are specific to Yemen. 
The workshop was a unique hybrid of 
CIPE and IFC’s expertise in corporate 
governance, adapted to the Yemeni 
context to benefit the entire business 
community.  

The IFC also plans to work with 
specific companies and banks in 
Yemen to help improve their specific 
governance practices and demonstrate 
the positive impact across the market. 

Yemeni businessmen train on corporate governance

The two-day workshop addressed the role of the board of directors; risk 
management; disclosure and shareholder relations, family-owned companies 
and sustainability. YT Photo by Nadia Al-Sakkaf
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Their News
JICA Dispatch 115 Yemeni Officials 

for Overseas Training in 2009

Within its technical cooperation 
scheme of Third Country Training 
Programme, Japan International 
Cooperation Agency (JICA) is going 
to train 115 Yemeni Officials in the 
various fields of health, water, irriga-
tion, marine & fisheries and electricity 
during the year 2009.

Third Country Training Programme 
(TCTP) is one of JICA’s oversees 
training that is conducted in middle-
level countries by organizations and 
personnel who have received Japanese 
technical cooperation and who provide 
this service of training to people of 
neighbouring countries based on their 
experience of development. JICA aims 
with this training programme to trans-
fer Japanese knowledge and technolo-
gies for more people, in an environ-
ment of shared language, culture and 
climate and also to create more oppor-
tunities of cooperation between devel-
oping countries. 

On May 31, 2009  JICA dispatched 
20 officials from the Ministry of 
Public Health and Population to Egypt 
to get training in the subject of 
“Women Health in Yemen” until July 
13, 2009. Through the training the 
participants acquired the necessary 
knowledge and experience on repro-
ductive health, health care delivery & 
feeding and nutrition during pregnan-
cy and lactation as well as on commu-
nication skills, health education and 
quality planning and improvement.  

On October 4, 2009   JICA is going 
to dispatch 10 instructors of the 
Marine Technical Institute- Aden of 
MoTEVT to Tunisia to get training on 
marine mechanics and marine electric-
ity until October 30, 2009. This train-
ing programme aims to enhance 
capacity building in fisheries in Yemen 
through the training of three batches 
totalling 28 Yemeni instructors in the 
Center of Fisheries Vocational Training 
in Mahdia, Tunisia.

On October 10, 2009 JICA is going 

to dispatch the second batch of 20 
engineers from the different imple-
menting agencies of Ministry of Water 
& Environment to Egypt to get train-
ing on water resources management in 
Yemen until November 5, 2009. This 
training programme aims to enhance 
the capacity building of water imple-
menting agencies in Yemen on ground-
water modelling, design of water net-
work, water quality & health impacts, 
hydrological design of water tanks, 
geographical information system and 
remote sensing as well as well opera-
tion and maintenance. 

In October & November 2009 JICA 
is going to dispatch three batches of 
45 engineers from Irrigation and Water 
Organizations in Yemen to Jordan to 
get training on high efficiency irriga-
tion technologies, water harvesting & 
spate irrigation, surface & groundwa-
ter monitoring technologies as well as 
communication skills for extension, 
with the aim to address the issue of 
water scarcity in Yemen.

In October 2009, JICA is going to 
dispatch the fifth batch of 20 engi-
neers from the Public Electricity 
Corporation to Jordan to get training 
on power generation and maintenance 
with the aim to develop human 
resources in electricity sector in 
Yemen.

Medecins Sans Frontieres urges the 

respect of health structures and 

medical work in Saada governorate

Medecins Sans Frontieres expresses 
deep concern over the health Situation 
in Sadaa governorate as access to 
health care facilities has become 
increasingly difficult over the past 
weeks due to the deteriorating situa-
tion resulting from the ongoing con-
flict.

“Given the insecurity on the roads 
to Saada town it has become extreme-
ly difficult for the people from all over 
the governorate to have access to the 
only two hospitals undertaking surgi-

cal interventions,” said MSF head of 
mission Andres Romero.

In Saada governorate four hospitals 
(Al Talh, Razeh, Al Salam and Al 
Jumhouri hospitals) are still functional 
and providing secondary health care, 
while only two hospitals – located in 
Saada town - are undertaking surgical 
intervention for the population.

According to MSF head of mission, 
access for patients to the two hospitals 
with surgical facilities is random in 
this volatile situation, therefore com-
plicated deliveries and urgent surgical 
cases cannot be treated unless they 
make it to Saada town. 

 MSF is supporting Yemeni Ministry 
of Health (MOH) hospitals in Razeh 
and Al Talh in order to maintain 
access to primary and secondary 
health care in the governorate.

However, since yesterday tension 
has increased in Al Talh town forcing 
the medical staff to leave the hospital 
there. 

MSF therefore calls for respecting 
health facilities and preserving their 
functionality.

“We urge all sides to respect Al Talh 
hospital and preserve the medical 
work being done there for the people” 
Romero added.

MSF has been working in Saada 
governorate in northern Yemen since 
September 2007, providing medical 
care to the population affected by the 
conflict between government forces 
and Al Houthi group that began in 
2004. 

MSF supports two MoH hospitals: 
one in Shara’a (Razeh district) and 
another one in Al Talh (Saher district). 
In both hospitals, primary and second-
ary care is provided free of charge, 
including Emergency consultations, 
hospitalisations and gyneco/obstetrical  
and surgical activities. 

World Bank: MENA region to grow 

4 percent in 2010

The World Bank forecast 2010 growth 

of 4 percent for the Middle East and 
North Africa region and said a pro-
jected oil price of $63 a barrel next 
year was sufficient to avoid a major 
crisis in oil producing states.

However it warned the region 
remained subject to significant down-
side risks because of its vulnerability 
to trade shocks, namely high depend-
ence on fuel exports and reliance on 
food imports, and could see surging 
unemployment and poverty rates.

Countries in the area would see 
their fiscal space shrink significantly 
as governments tried to stimulate their 
economies and subsidise higher food 
prices, the bank said in a report.

Non-oil exporters Lebanon, Jordan 
and Djibouti had no fiscal space left, 
it added.

The area suffered a sharp decline in 
growth to a forecast 2.2 percent in 
2009 from 6.1 percent the previous 
year.

Qatar would be a stand-out per-
former in the area, enjoying growth of 
18.2 percent in 2009 and 16.2 percent 
in 2010 as major liquid natural gas 
(LNG) plants come on-stream, while 
Kuwait was seen contracting this year 
by 1.2 percent and Saudi Arabia by 
0.9 percent.

“The Middle East and North 
Africa’s (MENA) weak integration 
with global financial markets partially 
insulated the region from the first-
round effects of the current economic 
downturn,” the World Bank said.

“But over the longer term, the 
region’s ability to cope with shocks is 
hampered by the limited development 
of the financial sector, limited access 
to financial services by households 
and firms, and limited exposure to 
global financial markets.”

Only 10 percent of firms in the 
region use banks for their financing, 
the report said.

The bank urged governments in the 
area to spur private sector job crea-
tion, to try and reduce high youth 
unemployment rates.

Yemen: Get Aid to Trapped 

Civilians

Yemeni authorities should allow aid 
agencies to help up to 150,000 civil-
ians trapped by fierce fighting in 
northern Yemen, Human Rights 
Watch said today.  A visit to Yemen 
on October 7 and 8, 2009, by John 
Holmes, the United Nations’ emer-
gency relief coordinator, can play an 
important role in bringing the appall-
ing humanitarian consequences of 
this conflict to the world’s attention, 
Human Rights Watch said.

In a letter sent to Holmes on 
October 1, Human Rights Watch 
urged him to call on the Yemeni 
authorities to facilitate aid agencies’ 
access to civilians in desperate need 
of food, water, shelter and health 
care. Holmes is the most senior UN 
representative to visit Yemen to 
address the humanitarian impact of 
the five-year-long conflict between 
the government and Huthi rebels. 
According to the UN, the fighting 
has displaced up to 150,000 people, 
most of whom remain beyond the 
reach of humanitarian assistance.

“Fighting and government restric-
tions means tens of thousands of 
civilians in northern Yemen are cut 
off from help that they desperately 
need,” said Joe Stork, deputy Middle 
East director at Human Rights 
Watch. “The government needs to 
help aid agencies reach civilians, not 
throw up obstacles in their way.”

Human Rights Watch urged 
Holmes to call on donors to respond 
generously to a UN appeal for US 
$23.7 million to help those affected. 
To date, only $3 million has been 
pledged.  A November 2008 Human 
Rights Watch report, “Invisible 
Civilians,” concluded that govern-
ment restrictions on humanitarian 
assistance during the conflict had 
placed civilians at risk. 

According to the UN, as of late 
September, aid agencies were unable 
to reach well over 100,000 civilians 

fleeing the fighting. Some agencies 
have sporadically been able to help 
thousands of the displaced who have 
found shelter in four camps in the 
town of Sa’ada, inside the conflict 
zone, in Hajjah governorate or else-
where outside Sa’ada governorate.  
The vast majority of the displaced  
live with needy host families, in bar 
ns and public buildings such as 
schools and clinics, under bridges, 
and under open skies on the side of 
roads. Almost all face food shortag-
es, and many cannot get clean 
water.

Neither the government nor the 
rebels have responded to UN calls 
to open humanitarian corridors. 
Authorities in Saudi Arabia have 
forcibly returned Yemeni refugees to 
the war zone. Civilians escaping the 
fighting said they had to walk for 
days through barren mountain ter-
rain to safety because roads were 
blocked by armed groups or cut off 
by fighting.

As of late September, witness 
accounts and credible reports by 
Yemeni human rights organizations 
indicated that both sides have failed 
to take all feasible steps to avoid 
harming civilians and their property, 
in violation of the laws of war. Huthi 
forces may have deployed their forc-
es within densely populated areas, 
unlawfully putting civilians at 
unnecessary risk. Government forces 
may have violated the laws of war 
in at least three separate incidents 
involving aerial bombardment that 
resulted in scores of civilian deaths. 
Human Rights Watch called on both 
sides to protect the civilian popula-
tion in accordance with international 
humanitarian and human rights law.

Human Rights Watch asked 
Holmes to call on Saudi authorities 
to immediately stop forcing refugees 
back into Yemen. Such actions vio-
late the international legal prohibi-
tion on forced return to places where 
their lives or freedom is threatened.

INTERNAL / EXTERNAL VACANCY ANNOUNCEMENT

Title of Post:   Associate Protection Officer   Starting Date: 01 Jan. 2010 (Detention) 
Post Number: New (NP- 92038)  
Category / Level: NOB             Duration: Up to 31 Dec. 2010 (renewable)
Location: Sana’a   Closing Date: 20 October 2009

DUTIES AND RESPONSIBILITIES:
UNHCR Office in Yemen wishes to engage an Associate Protection Officer to assist in establishing appropriate structures that 
will decrease the number of detained asylum seekers and refugees.  This project will contribute to the enhancement of 
protection environment for refugees mainly in decreasing the number of refouled refugees and asylum seekers. S/he will work 
under the supervision of the Protection Officer and perform the duties mentioned below.

Terms of reference (Duties)
Chair and follow-up on issues, with a working group, on detention which would be comprised of UNHCR, government and 
NGOs. The working group would meet on monthly basis to discuss all issues related to the detention of refugees and 
asylum seekers, and act as a forum for information sharing, developing advocacy strategies and other interventions.
Establishing a section within the Protection Unit dedicated to deal with detention issues.  This section will be headed by 
the NOB Protection Officer.  He/She will be assisted by one national volunteer based in Sana’a, that will assist in 
conducting prison visits, interview detainees to gather information related to the detention condition and liaising with the 
authorities.
Effective management of data related to detention including the building of a specific database for storing and managing 
information on refugees and asylum seekers in detention. Experiences in other countries including Arab countries where 
such databases have been developed could be drawn upon to provide information on the process in Yemen. The NOB 
Protection Officer will need to ensure that the detention database is regularly updated and will be responsible for receiving 
and managing detention reports and entering the data in the database.  
Establishing partnership with NGOs working on detention monitoring to monitor the situation of refugees, asylum seekers 
and other persons of concern to UNHCR who are in detention. One such NGO which has cooperated with UNHCR on ad 
hoc basis in the past is Hood Organization. A systematic partnership however would entail training of staff on refugee law 
and international protection principles, provision of incentives and travel costs to staff as well as support with 
documentation and resource material. 
Working more effectively in building networks with pro-bono lawyers to provide legal assistance to refugees and asylum 
seekers in detention. 
The NOB Protection Officer will also be responsible for coordinating detention activities with SO Aden and provide a 
monthly progress report including information on identified constraints to her/his supervisor.  The Officer will also provide 
ongoing training and perform additional tasks as requested and agreed.

QUALIFICATION REQUIREMENTS
Education: The incumbent should have University Degree in Law.  
Experience: At least 8 years of job experiences relevant to this function and 2 years in international capacity. 
Others: Possession of good computer and communication skills is essential. 
Languages: Very good knowledge of English and Arabic. 

For internal UNHCR candidates:
Staff may apply to vacant posts at their own level at any time. Under the reduced seniority requirement, staff who have 
completed at least half of the required seniority in grade will be considered. Candidates who do not meet the criteria as internal 
candidates can be considered as external candidates. 

For external candidates:
While priority will be given to Internal Candidates as per UNHCR guidelines, suitable External Candidates will be considered. 

IMPORTANT:
Applications received after the above mentioned closing date will not be considered. All applications should be sent to:

 The Administration Officer,
 UNHCR BO Sana’a
 P.O. Box 12093
 Sanaa.
 Tel. Contact: +967-1-469771/2 
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 By: Ali Saeed

The fly that transmits the 
screw worm disease still 
threatens animal wealth in 
Yemen, as almost 80 per-
cent of Yemen’s population 

lives in the countryside and depends 
on animal husbandry for survival, 
according to the General Director of 
the Animal Health Administration.

What makes the threat more serious 
is that Yemen can’t eradicate the fly, 
which can travel up to 200 km.

“The epidemic of the screw worm in 
Yemen can’t be eliminated, unless 
there will be regional and international 
cooperation in intervention as the indi-
vidual country can not do so alone,” 
said Al-Qadasi.

“At the end of 1980s this epidemic 
hit Libya and the whole world headed 
there to eliminate the disease,” added 
Al-Qadasi.

“Libya succeeded in disease elimi-
nation, because the entire world stood 
with her and they used an expensive 
technique to sterilize the insect,” 
explained the director.

“Using the Sterile Insect Technique 
to eradicate the disease has been suc-
cessfully achieved in freeing the coun-
tries of the USA, Mexico, Belize, 
Guatemala, Honduras, EI Salvador, 
Nicaragua, Costa Rica, Panama north 
of the Canal, some Caribbean Islands 

and the outbreak in Libya from the 
disease,” according to the Food and 
Agriculture Organization of the United 
Nations.

“The Humans, livestock, and wild-
life in these countries are now free of 
this dangerous pest,” according to 
FAO.

“Sterile Insect Technique is a meth-
od of biological elimination, where 
millions of sterile insects are released 
from planes,” explained Al-Qadasi.

“The released insects are male, as it 
is the female that causes the disease, 
usually by laying eggs in crops. The 
sterile males competes with the wild 
males for female insects. If a female 
mates with a sterile male then it will 

have no offspring, thus reducing the 
next generation’s population,” he 
added.

 But the director said this method is 
expensive, since it requires creating 
laboratories for raising insects and then 
sterilizing them with nuclear radioac-
tivity. An individual country can not 
do this task alone.

“There is now an under preparation 
project in the Middle-East, and Yemen 
was invited to this project,” said 
Al-Qadasi.

“The project is under the supervi-
sion of the International Atomic Energy 
Agency (IAEA),” he added.

“Today, animal production is a high 
priority in world agriculture. There is 
an increasing demand for meat, dairy, 
and egg production-major sources of 
animal protein for the world’s growing 
population,” the FAO pointed out. 

“In developing countries, animal 
production also provides food security, 
cash income to a large number of rural 
area people and benefits to the whole 
economy,” added the FAO. 

The disease hit new areas

According to Dr. Mohammed 
Al-Hadad, Director of Campaign 
Administration at the Animal Health 
Administration, since the outbreak of 
the disease in November 2007, the dis-
ease has killed 1832 cattle and sheep.

The outbreak started in Al Malahidh 
district in the Sa’ada governorate, bor-
dering Saudi Arabia and then moved to 
Hajja, Hodiedah and Mahwit.

In 2008, the disease severely hit the 
three governorates of Mahwit, Hajja 
and Hodiedah and the big loss was 
reported in Mahwit.

“The epidemic caused the death of 
1465 camels, cows, and sheep in 
Mahwit,” said Ahmed Al-Hasibi, 
Director of Animal Wealth 
Administration Office in the governor-
ate.

Now the infection has moved to hit 
the governorates of Taiz, Ibb, Thamar 
and Raima.

“In August and September this year, 
we received notifications from farmers 
in those governorates saying that the 
screw worm hit their areas,” said 
Al-Hadad.

“We responded to those notifications 

and sent veterinarians to treat infected 
cases, spray uninfected animals and 
yards with pesticides and train farmers 
on how to deal with the disease,” he 
added.

“Campaigns are still working in 
these newly-hit governorates and will 
continue until the infection reduces,” 
said Al-Hadad.

Vector controlling costs

Al-Qadasi described the fly as a mobile 
threat that travels easily.

 “The vector is a fly in the air and 
does not recognize borders,” he said.

“Since 2008, we have spent around 
YR 200 million (close to USD  mil-
lion) in spraying campaigns, providing 
medicine and training farmers on how 
to deal with the disease,” said 
Al-Qadasi.

“When the first outbreaks occurred 
in Sa’ada, Hodiedah, Hajja and 
Mahwit, we used to spray plants with 
pesticides to control the vector, but we 
realized that this method protects live-
stock and at the same time harms bee-
keeping, beekeepers and environment,” 
said Al-Qadasi.

“Most infected areas with screw 
worm are also places of beekeeping 
and spraying plants with pesticides 
threatens this sector, so we adopted 

new strategy for the vector combat-
ing,” explained Al-Qadasi.

“Now, the new strategy for combat-
ing the vector is to focus on farmers, 
train them on how to treat infected 
cases, provide them with medicines 
and appoint one veterinarian in each 
district to be a consultant for farmers,” 
said Al-Qadasi.

Factors make the vector surviving in 

Yemen

“There are many factors contribute to 
the survival of the vector in Yemen 
and enable it to adjust his life cycle 
along the year,” said Al-Qadasi.

“Stray animals, monkeys and humid-
ity are all made the life cycle of the fly 
to remain in the country,” explained 
Al-Qadasi.

  “In the Mahwit governorate, mon-
keys play an essential role in the sur-
vival of the fly and stand as an obsta-
cle in the vector eradication,” he con-
tinued.

“Through these factors, the fly is 
able to adapt and survive for long 
time,” said the director.

Moreover officials at the Animal 
Health Administration and Animal 
Wealth Offices in some governorates 
said that there is a high probability of 
a new outbreak as winter approaches.

“The good temperature for the vec-
tor is cool, and not hot and humid, so 
the fly is more active in winter,” said 
Al-Qadasi.

“In summer, the vector moves from 
hot areas to cool areas,” he added.

“In the past, the infection was mini-
mized because of campaigns, but an 
outbreak is expected again as winter 
approaches,” stated Ahmed Al-Hasibi, 
Director of Animal Wealth 
Administration office in Mahwit.

“Last September, the disease caused 
the death of 11 heads of sheep and 
goat in the governorate,” he added.

Economic consequences 

“The economic side of this disease is 
apparent in low animal production as a 
result of infection,” said Al-Hadad.

“Dairy, meat, and wool are the main 
losses that the infection causes, in 
addition to livelihoods of farmers,” 
said Al-Hadad.

Additionally, the director of the 
Animal Health Administration indicat-
ed that many charitable funds and non-
governmental organizations distribute 
sheep or cows to poor families to be a 
source of income for them.

“However, this disease kills and 
threatens such projects in the country,” 
pointed out the director.
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Screw worm causes economic loss To Yemen

Mansoor Al-Qadasi, General 

Director of the Animal Health 

Administration.

Almost 80 percent of Yemen’s population lives in the countryside and they 

primarily depend on livestock for their income.
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   By: Khaled Fattah      KF62@st-andrews.ac.uk 

Alice Hackman

Heather Murdock

For two consecutive days, it 
has been relatively quiet. 
The alternated gunshots 
and bombings have been 
isolated to one or two fires 

every six to eight hours. The military 
has not been frequently bringing 
either civilian or military casualties. I 
have never trusted the calm, especial-
ly during wars, because out in the 
dark or in a room, people are planning 
their next move. Yes, it is Ramadan, 
but I am not sure whether the rebels 
will eat during the first meal and 
enjoy it, when they have an opportu-
nity to wreak havoc against the mili-
tary. However, this is my opinion. It 
might not come to pass. The next 24 
to 48 hours is going to be a volatile 
time, because I heard that the rebels 
have reached the souk and the old city 
of Sa’ada. There, they are hiding 
amongst civilian houses and using 
them as human shields. If the military 
does penetrate the walls of the old 
city - this place is home to thousands 
of families - and one of the parties 
makes the mistake of triggering a bat-
tle within it, thousands of civilians 
will be caught in the crossfire. Parents 
will be left with dead children, and 
children will be orphaned. These 
things happen every day in Sa’ada. 
The casualties are not monitored or 
recorded, because dying patients or 
bodies are unable to get through the 
checkpoints set up by rebels or mili-
tary personnel.

What is the next step for both par-
ties? Now that the civilians are caught 
in the middle, they are unaware of the 
war’s implications and complications. 
There are so many stories I cannot 
follow and cannot specify whether if 
they are part of someone’s imagina-
tion or machination. My colleague 
told me that some of the shopkeepers 
in the souk were Houthis, but that 
they wouldn’t bother us because they 
respected foreigners. A doctor backed 
her statement that was quoted by 
another colleague who told her that 
the Houthis are nice and gentle. 

People in the souk are also fighting: 
six to ten of them against the medium 
to heavy artilleries of the military. 
Would you believe that story? Imagine 
six to ten people fighting tanks and 
fighter jets. If these people are well-
trained and intelligent, only in movies 
could they win when faced with thou-
sands of bullets and missiles fired 
against them. Neither slow motion nor 
acrobatic moves exist in real life. 

You are lucky if they shoot you in 
the abdomen and your vital organs are 
spared from the damage. We have 
patients like that: shot near the head 
and the bullet is seen floating between 
his skull and esophagus. He is still 
alive and kicking; walking against our 
advice to stay put in bed and rest. He 
is restless. He keeps on chewing qat 
despite his injuries. I tell him it’s 
going to produce a lot of effects if 
combined with medications. Believe 
me, our patients in Sa’ada have built 
up a tolerance to pain relievers. They 
get an extra dose because one shot 
wouldn’t work on them. 

On the night of August 25th and 
26th, we weren’t busy compared to 
the past nights I have experienced, 
when the casualties of war come at 
the wee hours of morning. The feeling 
is like having someone light a fire in 
your pants. You run towards one 
patient, and then to another. 

It rained for half an hour on the 
afternoon of 27th.  I thought I could 
hear thunder claps, but then fighter 
jets passed by. I wondered when I 
would be able to see one, because 
they always hide on top of the clouds, 
like they are wearing an invisibility 
cloak. I knew they were there to drop 
bombs. It rained so heavily that it 
made a stream inside the compound. 
My friends bought umbrellas, and we 
played under the rain. It was beauti-
ful. Our backs were wet and it had 
gotten colder. We had to enjoy the 
moment because we knew that at any 
second, we could be required to save 
lives. 

I was supposed to work overtime, 
because usually there are many 
patients during the evenings in 
Ramadan. This was canceled because 
there was a lot of staff available. After 
spending the afternoon with my 
friends, I did my laundry, cleaned my 
room, and took a refreshing bath. I 
thought that I would have the whole 
day to spend in my room or out in the 
library, surfing the net. It was also my 
friend’s second wedding anniversary. 
My activities were already planned, 
since I knew I would not be working 
overtime. I want to spend as much 
time with my family before proceed-
ing with my plans.

Around 6:30 pm, just after the 
mosques started to pray before the 
first meal of the day, I heard the most 
violent rounds of gun firing and 
explosions. We all had to look out of 
our windows or go out to the hospital 
grounds to see what was happening. 
Obviously, it was too far for us too 
see the battle, but we had to look out 
for anything out of the ordinary. 
Everyone had their own story to tell, 
but I was inside my room recording 
the explosions on my laptop. I had to. 
I have my own stories. At that 
moment, another employee ran into 
my room and told me I had a call 
from our supervisor. I knew I would 
have to work that day. I ran towards 
the telephone in the hallway and 
answered it. She instructed me to go 
to the hospital because they were 
busy. Luckily, I had taken a bath ear-
lier and ironed my uniform. I put on 
my scrubs and ran to the hospital. The 
ER was busy and there were six 
patients ready for operations. I 
approached one of my friends with 
whom I’d had a moment in the rain 
earlier in the afternoon, and asked him 
if I could help. I took the consent 
forms for operation and asked for the 
military representative to sign it in 
behalf of the patients. There were too 
many patients, so they became con-
fused.  It took us until 8 pm to finish 
all of the documents and the orders 
for the doctors. Soldiers with shrapnel 
and gunshot wounds were coming in 

one by one. We waited for 20 dead 
soldiers to come for registration, but 
they never arrived. I don’t know if 
they were still coming, because we 
left the ER after 11 pm and they still 
weren’t there.

My friends and I played computer 
games after our shift. It was only then 
that I remembered the story about a 
family who was hit by a missile or a 
bomb in the morning. I don’t know 
the details- whether they were sleep-
ing or eating together.  They were 
rushed to the hospital. Their father 
was declared dead on arrival, the 
mother who was 7 months pregnant 
had shrapnel on her abdomen and had 
to undergo an operation, one of her 
sons was hit in the head and his brains 
were pouring out. He eventually died 
in the evening shift, and the other 
children were unharmed, but left 
fatherless and with one of their broth-
ers dead. The motto in Sa’ada has 
always been, “That’s life.” Most peo-
ple think losing a loved one is part of 
the process, whether it was because 
they died of a disease, an epidemic, or 
old age. But for most of you, does 
your life really matter? Your life is 
what you make out of it. You are the 
captain of your starship. 

The pregnant mother delivered a 
healthy baby, who we kept in the 
nursery, but she kept on asking about 
one of her sons who was hit in the 
head. She broke into tears because we 
couldn’t find the courage to tell her 
that her son was dead. There is always 
a promise of new life amongst the 
new generations, but who will father 
the unborn and those who were born? 
The old have proven strong against 
hardships, but these fragile souls: how 
about them? Will they also carry arms 
and fight an unending battle? What is 
the fate awaiting them? All of these 
queries are still unanswered. It is up 
to the people of Yemen to decide. As 
for my theory that the military was 
eating when they were attacked; I was 
right. I hope that this will serve as a 
lesson. We have to live with the fact 
that in one way or another, there are 
people in the world who are evil. 

Yemen’s Revolution and State
Institutions: a retrospective view 

Trapped:Memories of Sa’ada
in August, 2009

Sa'ada Thoughts is a series of reflections on life and people in Sa'ada from an independent perspective, 
written by a nurse from the Philippines who had been working in Sa'ada for two years. He could be 
reached at levy9ph2000@yahoo.com.

There could be no more 
opportune time to have a 
serious discussion about 
Yemen’s state institutions 
than now. Forty-seven 

years after the revolutionary military 
coup of September 1962, which 
brought an end to the stagnant theo-
cratic imamate system, the dominant 
forces of violence, poverty and poor 
governance continue to shape the 
form of state-society relations in 
Yemen. The current instability dem-
onstrates the failure of Yemen’s politi-
cal elites to create strong and effective 
state institutions that are capable of 
monitoring, influencing and control-
ling the socio-political and economic 
life in Yemen. 

In this column, I have been always 
calling for strengtheing Yemen’s state 
institutions. Strong Yemeni state does 
not mean, however, as some readers 
thought, a state that punishes and 
coerces. Fierce states such as Iraq of 
Saddam are the ones who punish and 
coerces. Strong states, on the other 
hand, are the ones who achieve their 
objectives not through the use of harsh 
prisons and firing squads, but rather 
through the use of responsive, inclu-
sive, accountable, participative and 
equitable system of governance. A ret-
rospective view of post revolutionary 
Yemen reveals how Egypt of Nasser 
laid the wrong foundations of Yemen’s 
modern institutions. 

The heavy Egyptian military inter-
vention in support of the republican 
officers was accompanied by Egyptian 
attempts at constructing a political, 
economic and administrative body for 
newly born republic of Yemen. For 
Nasser, north Yemen represented an 
opportunity for reasserting his waning 
influence in the Arab world, spreading 
his ideology to the monarchies of the 
Arabian Peninsula, and expelling the 
British from their last regional strong-
hold in Aden. In addition to these rea-
sons, Nasser, was interested in inter-
fering in Yemen because of the new 
revolutionary military leadership that 
was willing to follow his lead, and 
because of the chance to create a state 

structure from scratch based on 
Nasserist model. To these political 
motives, one may include geostrategic 
reasons, namely the Egyptian domi-
nance of the Red Sea from the Suez 
Canal to Bab-al- Mandab Strait. 

Nasser was determined, therefore, 
to strengthen Yemen’s Arab Republic 
(YAR) by all means. To achieve this, 
in addition to the military protection, 
Egyptian advisors carried out the task 
of erecting ministries and state agen-
cies that should implement the YAR 
decisions and commands. 
Unfortunately, such ministries and 
agencies were white elephants and 
pale copies of their Cairo originals. 
For example, a Yemeni ministry for 
aviation was established at a time 
when Yemen had one passenger air-
plane and three pilots only.  
Furthermore, most of Yemen’s state 
agencies were staffed and managed by 
Egyptian bureaucrats who introduced 
a highly centralized and hydraulic 
Egyptian structure into the highly 
decentralized and fragmented tribal 
YAR. In other words, the Egyptian 
staff performed the administrative 
tasks of the YAR without a focus on 
the actual needs of the YAR. However, 
despite the fatal mistakes of the 
Egyptian bureaucracy in Yemen, the 
Egyptian support to the new and sole 
republic in Arabia has altered the total 
political and administrative look of 
the Yemeni state. It was Egypt of 
Nasser that introduced to the Northern 
Yemeni state the concept of govern-
ment involvement in all areas other 
than security, religiously-based taxa-
tion and justice. The Egyptian admin-
istration extended the scope of public 
education and constructed the founda-
tions for specialized state agencies 
entrusted with the task of planning 
and implementing the will of the 
state. 

During the 1962-70 civil war, the 
extensive Egyptian support to the 
republicans resulted in creating a cen-
trally organized political-military 
structure that had a firm control over 
Yemen’s triangle of urban concentra-
tions, which included Sana’a, Taizz 

and Hodidah. The control of the roy-
alists, on the other hand, over the 
north, northeast, northwest and a big 
part of the eastern regions of Yemen, 
was not direct in nature. Instead, it 
was through alliances with leaders of 
autonomous tribes. Furthermore, while 
it is true that the republican central 
government could not control 50% of 
the territory of the state during night-
time hours, it was, however, capable 
of controlling and managing the 
access to schools, roads, clinics and 
the new pipe water system. Royalists 
and their allies in tribal areas could 
not compete with the republican cen-
tral authority in the provision of mod-
ern urban services. In my view, the 
failure of royalists to compete with 
the republicans in providing and man-
aging modern urban infrastructure 
was a victory for the idea of a modern 
centralized authority in Yemen.  

Following the departure of Egyptian 
forces in 1967 and the drying out of 
the Egyptian funding, Riyadh became 
the main source for the survival of the 
YAR. This rapid change of external 
source of survival illustrates that 
already in her first few years the sole 
republic in Arabia was infected with 
Arabian rentierism. The YAR depen-
dence on Saudi Arabia and Arab Gulf 
sheikhdoms reached its peak in the 
1970s when Saudi Arabia was even 
paying the monthly salaries of its gov-
ernment functionaries and army per-
sonnel. By making the YAR economi-
cally dependent on fat Saudi grants 
and on the remittances of Yemeni 
labour migrants in Saudi Arabia, the 
Saudis had managed to change the 
original republican revolutionary fea-
tures of the YAR and made it a con-
servative tribal republic.

The long bloody experience of the 
civil war resulted in delaying the proj-
ect of state building in the YAR. This 
is because security and order con-
sumed most of the political attention 
and the limited economic sources of 
the YAR.  In other words, the years of 
the civil war have diverted the atten-
tion of reforms from the essential task 
of state building. Finally, the severe 
instability and bloodshed, which the 
civil war produced in the immediate 
aftermath of the revolution, activated 
the search for a viable political for-
mula around which to build a consen-
sus between traditional and modern 
forces. Today, it is clear that tradition-
al tribal forces have severly defeated 
reformists and modernists. Forty-
seven years after the revolution, the 
Yemeni state remains fragile and 
infested with violence, instability and 
uncertainties. Is there anyway out for 
the Yemeni state? Yes there is: state 
institutions and processes that serve 
all stakeholders, mediation of the dif-
ferent interests in society to reach a 
broad consensus in society on what is 
in the best interest of the whole com-
munity and how this can be achieved, 
and impartial enforcement of laws. 

Khaled Fattah is an academic research-

er and political analyst. He can be 

reached at KF62@st-andrews.ac.uk
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A common saying in the 
Arab world goes: “Seek 
knowledge, even as far as 
China!” Yet if everything 
goes the way Saudi 

Arabia’s King Abdullah wishes, seekers 
of knowledge in his kingdom will not 
have to travel quite as far in future.

Close to Jeddah, less than 100 kilo-
metres away from Mecca, a new uni-
versity has now opened its doors. The 
King Abdullah University of Science 
and Technology, KAUST for short, 
aims to become one of the best in the 
world. 
King Abdullah has invested 12.5 billion 
dollars in KAUST. The campus is 36 
square kilometres in size and equipped 
with state-of-the-art laboratories, pro-
viding workplaces for outstanding 
research and teaching staff from around 
t h e  w o r l d .  
 
Modelled on MIT
Two thirds of the 2000 places at the 
university will also go to foreign gradu-
ate students. KAUST intends to join the 
ranks of the world’s leading research 
universities, its role model being the 
Massachusetts Institute of Technology.

The university has certainly gained a 
number of big names as partner institu-
tions: Berkeley, Cambridge, Stanford, 
Imperial College London and 
Germany’s Munich Technical 
University. 

These universities are receiving sev-
en-figure sums to forward their research 
projects at KAUST, focusing on the bio 
and nano-sciences, energy technology, 
materials science and IT.

The Munich university is getting 21 
million dollars for three projects. One 
of these is a three-dimensional imaging 
project for Saudi Arabia, depicting not 
only the country’s surface but also the 
geological structures below ground.

KAUST is driving up Saudi Arabia’s 
higher education fever, a common phe-
nomenon in the Gulf states in recent 
years. The sheikhs have realised that 

the end of the oil period is nigh, and are 
looking for alternatives to secure the 
future of their principalities. 
 
Knowledge as raw material
Tomorrow’s raw material is knowledge, 
and the sciences and technology are in 
great demand. Because time is of the 
essence but the quality has to be high, 
expertise is bought in – mainly from 
the West.

The universities are happy to come, 
especially from the USA, Australia and 
Britain. The Gulf region is a growth 
market, and the aim is to stake a claim 
early on. Education is becoming an 
export leader. Qatar, for instance, has 
built a huge Education City, where sev-
eral different American universities are 
offering courses. 

The Sorbonne has founded a subsid-
iary in the emirate of Abu Dhabi, while 
Dubai’s ruler hopes to push research by 
means of a billion-dollar foundation.

And now Saudi Arabia is taking its 
first steps towards the knowledge soci-
ety. 

The theocracy is a country where a 
great deal to do with free thinking is 
simply banned. A country at the very 
bottom of the academic rankings with 
one of the world’s worst educational 
systems. 

Where religious scholars and the reli-
gious police have the say. Can this new 
direction ever work?

KAUST is intended to stand for lib-
eralism. 

The university has been erected quasi 
on ex-territorial ground, and is meant to 
be able to act independently of the 
Saudi ministries. Women and men are 
meant to study and research together, 
with women even allowed to drive cars 
– perhaps a small matter in scientific 
terms but with great symbolic value for 
Saudi Arabia. KAUST will change 
society, Saudi dignitaries promised 
when the foundation stone was laid in 
2007.

New example of Saudi megaloma-
nia?
Critics, including in the Arab world, 
have labelled the project a new example 
of the usual Saudi megalomania, which 
would lead to little in the end.

Yet there is one sign that the promis-
es of internationalisation are more than 
mere lip service – the man appointed 
president. He is Choon Fong Shih, a 
Harvard-trained engineer and until 
recently head of the University of 
Singapore. And another indication that 
Saudi Arabia really means business is 
the fact that the state oil company 
Aramco was commissioned with build-
ing the university, rather than the less 
efficient higher education ministry.

It remains to be seen how far the 
King Abdullah University can really 
reach out of the ivory tower to influ-
ence Saudi society. And whether it is a 
model that meets the country’s needs: 
have the authorities thought to interlock 
it with the Saudi economy and business 
world? What opportunities will Saudi 
graduates have to employ what they 
learn there in their own country?

King Abdullah is aiming to transform 
Saudi Arabia, not just in the educational 
sector. But the king is 85 years old, and 
the reform projects are very closely tied 
to him personally. The Saudi desert will 
be the site of an interesting experiment 
in the years to come.
___________________________
Arnfrid Schenk
© Die Zeit / Qantara.de 2009 
Translated from the German by Katy 
Derbyshire

Educational reform in Saudi Arabia 
Higher Education fever hits Gulf States

The watchword of the moment in Saudi Arabia’s educational sector 
is modernisation. The latest example is the recently opened “King 
Abdullah University” near Jeddah, which is attracting top research-
ers from around the world. Arnfrid Schenk has the details

The King Abdullah University in 
Thuwal near Jeddah is Saudi 
Arabia’s only university where men 
and women can study side by side 

JOB VACANCY
National Consultant:

National Human Rights Strategy
Location: Sana’a – Yemen
Application Deadline: 12 October 2009
Nationality: Yemeni 
Duration: 30 days.

Background: 
The UNDP Project of Enhancing National Human Rights Capacity in Yemen, aims at 
strengthening the capacity of both the Government and civil society organizations to 
promote, protect and respect human rights in Yemen. The programme will focus on the 
following three areas; law harmonization, development of a national human rights strategy 
and support to Civil Society Organisations
This consultancy will constitute the first phase of activities to develop the Yemeni National 
Human Rights Strategy with broad consultations with Yemeni citizens. The strategy will 
include law harmonization, human rights education curriculum development etc. The 
findings/recommendations from this exercise will be the basis for developing and 
implementing the process of developing the strategy

Duties & Responsibilities:
The National Consultant, working alongside an International Consultant, will undertake the 
following tasks:
• Review similar processes undertaken elsewhere and identify best practices and 

lessons learnt in developing National Human Rights Strategies
• Identify components, issues and stakeholders to be included in developing the National 

Human Rights Strategy
• Recommend a strategy  and work plan for the process of developing the national 

human rights strategy

Qualifications & competencies:
• Advanced Degree in law, international law, human rights or related fields
• Extensive knowledge of the human rights and gender equality situation in Yemen
• Minimum 5 years of proven work experience in the, human rights, or gender equality 

areas
• Demonstrated knowledge and experience with research, writing, and analysis in the 

field of international human rights
• Excellent knowledge of computer software 
• Excellent knowledge of written and spoken Arabic and English.

To apply for this position please forward your CV along with a cover letter to: 
UNDP-YEMEN

Attn: Ms. Amal Ali
E-mail: procurement.ye@undp.org      

Vender Registration website: www.undp.org.ye/procurement.php
Fax: + 967 1 448841

YEMEN

JOB VACANCY
National Consultant:

Human Rights Curriculum
Location: Sana’a – Yemen 
Application Deadline: 12 October 2009
Nationality: Yemeni 
Duration: 30 days.

Background:                                                                                                                                   
The UNDP Project of Enhancing National Human Rights Capacity in Yemen aims at 
strengthening the capacity of both the Government and civil society organizations to promote, 
protect and respect human rights in Yemen. The program will focus on the following three areas; 
law harmonization, development of a national human rights strategy and support to Civil Society 
Organizations
This consultancy will constitute the first phase of activities to develop human rights and gender 
sensitive curriculum for schools and universities. The objectives of the consultancy are:
• Assessing the curriculum for education as well as teacher education to determine areas 

where and how human rights principles can be included
•  Recommend the process and methodology for incorporating human rights education in the 

curricula for schools, universities and teacher education.

The findings/recommendations from this exercise will be the basis for developing and 
implementing activities for mainstreaming human rights and gender in educational institutions.

Duties & Responsibilities:
The consultant will undertake this work with an International consultant and will undertake the 
following Specific Tasks:
1. Identify current efforts or initiatives undertaken on human rights curriculum development in 

Yemen
2. Review literature and school books to obtain information on the inclusion of human rights
3.  Review the curriculum for schools and teacher training and identify areas where human 

rights can be incorporated
4. Produce work plan and recommendations on the process and methodology for   incorporating 

human rights into the school curriculum and curriculum for training teachers 

Qualifications & Competencies:
• A postgraduate degree in Education, human rights or related field with an emphasis on 

curriculum development
• Comprehensive knowledge of human rights, UN treaties and conventions 
• Minimum 5years experience in human rights education. 
• Experience in situational analysis and preparation of reports with strategic recommendations 

and capacity to develop practical solutions to multifaceted problems 
• High level of communication skills, and competent in report writing 
• Excellent knowledge of written and spoken Arabic and English.

To apply for this position please forward your CV along with a cover letter to: 
UNDP-YEMEN

Attn: Ms. Amal Ali
E-mail: procurement.ye@undp.org   

Vender Registration website: www.undp.org.ye/procurement.php
Fax: + 967 1 448841 
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Why has it taken so long for the club 

to be active?

The club was established with a vision 

to develop capabilities and enhance the 

efficiency of its members and eventual-

ly the Yemeni economy. In other words, 

the club existed because of its members 

and hence its activities are also depen-

dant on the time its members can spare- 

especially since it is not their main 

business. Moreover, not all business-

men and women are members, and only 

recently did our membership base 

expand significantly. This year we par-

ticipated in organizing a very large 

scale event called “Made in Yemen,” 

which was held in Hadramout in 2008.

We have recently increased the num-

ber of staff in our club in order to be 

able to create better functions for our 

members. There are a number of busi-

ness initiatives or directories established 

by other business entities, but until now 

I am not convinced by the quality pro-

duced so far.  This is why we are gradu-

ally trying to fill in a gap in the busi-

ness sector.

What are the sources of income for 

the club?

We have membership fees which are 

USD 500 per year, as well as some 

commissions we get through conduct-

ing services for members and non 

members, such as obtaining visas for 

some countries.

Recently, we have also expanded our 

activities to provide training, based on 

the members’ needs.

You mentioned the Made in Yemen 

conference in coordination with the 

Chamber of Commerce. What is the 

relation between the club and this 

chamber?

The Yemeni Businessmen Club is a 

business organization working inline 

and parallel with other chambers and 

the Federation of Chambers.  We main-

tain a good relation with all fellow 

organizations.  In fact, we at YBC are 

focusing on issues usually unattended 

to by other business organizations such 

as family business issues, corporate 

governance and senior management 

training.

What about the General Investment 

Authority?

It is a normal relationship, like any 

other private sector organization.  

Recently, YBC has been represented on 

the newly proposed board of the GIA.

Do you see the club as a successful 

business organization?

I am glad to see the YBC growing from 

day to day, and playing an active role in 

the private sector live in Yemen. My 

priorities are well set forth in the strate-

gic plan of the YBC, and we are work-

ing on the following:

A corporate governance guidelines 

document, increasing the awareness and 

motivating stakeholders to adopt it 

Family business technical assistance

Issuing and maintaining the economic 

annual report

Building a research and studies unit of 

the YBC

Exploring new projects

Reaching sustainability through the 

provision of outstanding and focused 

training programs for the members and 

their companies

There is a newly formed union for 

agriculture exporters. Are you inter-

ested in cooperating with them? 

How?

We are interested, and I’m a member of 

that initiative and the issue of coopera-

tion is still under consideration.

How did the International Economic 

Crisis affect business profitability in 

Yemen?

It has its impact on the market demand 

which has resulted in deteriorating prof-

itability for a number of companies. We 

are in the process of issuing our period-

ic report, which will include our evalu-

ation of the outcomes.

Does the business community have a 

code of ethics?

So far, no, but in my opinion they 

should have one.

Do you have activities for social 

responsibility and community servic-

es?

Many of our members have their own 

social activities. We are encouraging 

them to organize it and systemize it 

through institutions. But we aspire to 

do more. In our economic report, we 

have dedicated a chapter on current 

practices, and recommended actions. 

We will follow up by exploring and 

implementing those recommendations 

for social responsibility.

Do you play a role in solving business 

conflicts?

There have been no conflicts so far, but 

we are in the process of establishing the 

Arbitration and Resolving Conflict Unit 

within the club.

How do you deal with businessmen 

who smuggle goods into the country?

We do not accept them as members.

How empowered is the businesswom-

en’s department?

We have a promising plan, that is for 

the time being.

Yemen has identified a number of 

economic sectors as promising, which 

are those economic sectors you see as 

having the most potential for growth 

in the next few years? 

Effective measures to encourage invest-

ment in all sectors would be the best 

promising options. 

Are you involved in efforts to estab-

lish a dialogue mechanism to involve 

the private sector in the development 

of government economic policies? 

How do see this involvement materi-

alizing?  

We are doing our best to establish a 

dialogue mechanism between private 

sector and government. We always par-

ticipate in activities involving the eco-

nomic issues.  We have been, for the 

last decade, hearing about the social-

economic council that government is 

talking about, but we have not seen any 

practical move.  This council, if materi-

alized, will facilitate and help the part-

nership great deal.

The Yemeni government, through the 

ministries of trade and planning, is 

trying to implement a number of 

reforms aiming at improving the 

business environment. How do you 

evaluate the success of these efforts?

Thus far, most of the government initia-

tives to improve the business climate 

have not succeeded due to one simple 

reason, which is lack of partnership. 

Unfortunately, the government has been 

making unilateral decisions without 

realizing the need to involve the private 

sector in the economic affairs. We have 

been hearing and reading a lot about the 

government-private sector partnership, 

but we have seen few actions.
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Yemen Times interview with Ahmed Bazara, 

Chairman of the Yemeni Businessmen Club
The Yemeni Businessmen Club was established in 2002, as a non-profit orga-

nization to bring together business people in a friendly professional environ-

ment. The club aims to strengthen business relations by sharing experiences. 

Since its establishment, the club has passed through several phases. And 

since the beginning of this year, it has been organizing a variety of activities, 

conferences, forums and workshops, and produced an annual economic 

report.

Nadia Al-Sakkaf interviewed Ahmed Bazara on the club and the business 

sector in Yemen. 

The club seeks to strengthen links 
between members, and to develop 
their institutions and contribute to the 
overall development process through 
the implementation of programs and 
activities and lead by trust and a spir-
it of cooperation. 

 
Objectives 
The club is working to achieve the 
following objectives: 
•	
�
     Strengthen	
�
    the	
�
    linkages	
�
    between	
�
    

members 
•	
�
     Improve	
�
     the	
�
     professionalism	
�
     of	
�
    

the members and contribute to 
the development of the perfor-
mance of their institutions

•	
�
     Exchange	
�
     of	
�
     professional	
�
     exper-
tise and mutual benefits among 
members 

•	
�
     Enhance	
�
     communication	
�
     and	
�
    
cooperation with internal and 
external	
�
    organizations	
�
    to	
�
    achieve	
�
    
the objectives of the club 

•	
�
     Contribute	
�
    to	
�
    the	
�
    development	
�
    of	
�
    
the business environment 

•	
�
     Contribute	
�
    to	
�
    the	
�
    development	
�
    of	
�
    
society

Management of the club: 

General Assembly
They are members of the club that 
meet once a year and they elect the 
Board of Drectors. 

The Board of Directors
A body elected by the General 
Assembly every three years that con-
sists of 11 members, and is respon-
sible for the performance of the club 
before the General Assemby. They 
are:
•	
�
     Ahmed	
�
     Abubakar	
�
     Bazara,	
�
    

Chairman.	
�
    
•	
�
     Fathi	
�
     Abdel-­Wasea	
�
     Saeed,	
�
    

Secretary-­General.	
�
    
•	
�
     Adel	
�
     Ali	
�
     Al-­Hadha,	
�
     	
�
     Assistant	
�
    

Secretary	
�
    General.	
�
    
•	
�
     Yousof	
�
    	
�
    Abdu	
�
    Koraimi.	
�
    
•	
�
     Ahmed	
�
    Mohamed	
�
    Jumaan.	
�
    
•	
�
     Shukri	
�
    Abdullah	
�
    Alforais.	
�
    
•	
�
     Dr.	
�
    Nayel	
�
    Rashid	
�
    Mocerd.	
�
    
•	
�
     Mohammed	
�
    Abdu	
�
    Murshid.	
�
    
•	
�
     Ghamdan	
�
    Ahmed	
�
    Al-­Anesi.	
�
    
•	
�
     Ali	
�
    Mohamed	
�
    Hebashi.
•	
�
     Mohamed	
�
     Abdel-­Salam	
�
    

Almekhlafi.

Audit Control Committee of 
Inspection and Control
A body elected by the General 
Assembly every three years that 
supervises the financial and adminis-
trative activities of the club, and they 
are: 

•	
�
     Abdullah	
�
    Ahmad	
�
    Al-­Hadha.
•	
�
     Tariq	
�
    Abdullah.	
�
    
•	
�
     Mohamed	
�
    Ahmed	
�
    Al-­Basha.	
�
    

The Advisory Board
Headed	
�
     by	
�
     Dr.	
�
     Dawood	
�
     Abdulmalik	
�
    
Al-­Hidabi.

Executive Management 
Headed	
�
     by	
�
     Ali	
�
     Al-­Azaki	
�
     who	
�
     is	
�
     the	
�
    
Executive	
�
     Director,	
�
     who	
�
     also	
�
     coordi-
nates the following units: 

Business Environment 
Development Unit
This unit is concerned environmental 
studies	
�
     in	
�
     Yemen.	
�
     It	
�
     highlights	
�
     busi-
ness and environment changes with 
appropriate programs, and a follows 
Yemeni	
�
     legislation	
�
    affecting	
�
     the	
�
    busi-
ness environment and discusses it 
with the members and the relevant 
government authorities. 

Unit Studies and Research 
This unit is dedicated to producing 
reports and studies on the various 
aspects of the business environ-
ment. 

Training Center 
This unit was established to achieve 
the club objective of enhancing the 
performance of the members’ com-
panies and the overall business com-
munity	
�
    in	
�
    general.	
�
    It	
�
    provides	
�
    training	
�
    
programs in areas related to account-
ing, and management according 
international	
�
     quality	
�
     standards	
�
     in	
�
    
training.

Information and Relations 
This unit is meant to enhance the 
club’s	
�
     internal	
�
     as	
�
     well	
�
     as	
�
     external	
�
    
relations with stakeholders. 
Furthermore,	
�
     it	
�
     is	
�
     responsible	
�
     for	
�
    
media campaigns and educating the 
public, as well as raising awareness 
on issues of importance to the club. 
It	
�
    also	
�
    updates	
�
    the	
�
    club	
�
    Web	
�
    site.	
�
    

Family Business Unit 
Because 90 percent of the compa-
nies	
�
     in	
�
    Yemen	
�
     are	
�
     family-­based,	
�
     the	
�
    
issue of family business came up, so 
the club established a unit dedicated 
to provide support services to those 
companies through family counseling 
as well as through studies address-
ing	
�
     their	
�
     problems.	
�
     It	
�
     provides	
�
     pro-
grams that help to regulate and sus-
tain this vital sector through various 
activities like conferences, work-
shops, seminars and coordination 
and cooperation with similar regional 
and international activities. 

The Corporate Governance Unit 
Due to the importance of disclosure 
and transparency on stability and 
growth	
�
     of	
�
     the	
�
     Yemeni	
�
     economy,	
�
     the	
�
    
club has set up a separate unit for 
handling the corporate governance 
issue.	
�
    It	
�
    aims	
�
    to	
�
    raise	
�
    the	
�
    awareness	
�
    
of the public on the importance of 
governance through various activi-
ties. 

Membership and New Branches 
Unit 
This unit seeks to enhance the com-
munication and relationships between 
the members, as well as support 

them with different services and help 
coordinate	
�
    their	
�
    activities.	
�
    In	
�
    addition,	
�
    
it helps establish new branches. 

Businesswomen Unit 
Despite	
�
    the	
�
    existence	
�
    of	
�
    some	
�
    activi-
ties	
�
     for	
�
     businesswomen	
�
     in	
�
     Yemen,	
�
    
this sector is still weak and immature 
and needs intensive technical as well 
as moral support to be sustainable 
and to be able to contribute to the 
national economy. Due to that fact, 
the club established a unit dedicated 
to providing the necessary assistance 
to businesswomen. 
The	
�
    Businessmen	
�
    Family	
�
    Unit
This unit is responsible for social 
activities for businessmen’s families 
in order to improve their knowledge, 
skills and relationships. 

  
Membership criteria

•	
�
     The	
�
    applicant	
�
    should	
�
    not	
�
    be	
�
     less	
�
    
than 25 years old.

•	
�
     The	
�
    applicant	
�
    should	
�
    be	
�
    a	
�
    direc-
tor, deputy director or a partner 
in a well known company.

•	
�
     Committed	
�
     to	
�
     pay	
�
     the	
�
     annual	
�
    
fees.

•	
�
     Must	
�
     accept	
�
     and	
�
     abide	
�
     by	
�
     the	
�
    
club rules and regulations. 

Our Activities

Conferences
The	
�
    Family	
�
    Business	
�
    Conference	
�
    will	
�
    
be held every two years. The first 
one	
�
    was	
�
    organized	
�
    in	
�
    February	
�
    2007.	
�
    
It	
�
     was	
�
     attended	
�
     by	
�
     more	
�
     than	
�
     300	
�
    
participants over two days, and was 
under the patronage of the former 
Prime	
�
     Minister	
�
     Abdul-­Qader	
�
    
Ba-­Jammal.

The first Businesswomen Gathering 
was	
�
     held	
�
     in	
�
     December	
�
     2007	
�
     and	
�
    
attended by more than 100 business-
women under the patronage of the 
Minister	
�
     of	
�
     Industry	
�
     and	
�
     Trade	
�
     Dr.	
�
    
Yahya	
�
    Mutawakil.	
�
    
The	
�
     Corporate	
�
     Governance	
�
    

Conference	
�
     was	
�
     held	
�
     in	
�
     the	
�
     early	
�
    
2008	
�
    in	
�
    collaboration	
�
    with	
�
    the	
�
    Center	
�
    
for	
�
     International	
�
     Private	
�
     Enterprise	
�
    
CIPE	
�
     of	
�
     the	
�
     American	
�
     Chamber	
�
     of	
�
    
Commerce.
The	
�
     Industry	
�
     and	
�
     the	
�
     Future	
�
     of	
�
    

Yemen	
�
     is	
�
     held	
�
     in	
�
     the	
�
     city	
�
     of	
�
    Mukalla	
�
    
and	
�
    organized	
�
    by	
�
    the	
�
    club	
�
    in	
�
    partner-
ship	
�
    with	
�
    the	
�
    Chamber	
�
    of	
�
    Commerce	
�
    
and	
�
     Industry	
�
     Hadramout,	
�
     under	
�
     the	
�
    
patronage of the President of the 
Republic.	
�
    The	
�
    guest	
�
    of	
�
    honor	
�
    was	
�
    Mr.	
�
    
Mahathir	
�
    Mohammad.

Seminars, workshops and studies 
The	
�
     club	
�
     organized	
�
     in	
�
     2004	
�
     the	
�
     first	
�
    
economic forum sponsored by the 
Ministry	
�
     of	
�
     Industry,	
�
     entitled	
�
     “Yemen	
�
    
and	
�
    the	
�
    Arab	
�
    Free	
�
    Trade	
�
    Zone.”
The	
�
     first	
�
    workshop	
�
     for	
�
     the	
�
    Yemeni	
�
    

Corporate	
�
     Board	
�
     of	
�
     Directors	
�
    
Members,	
�
     which	
�
     was	
�
     held	
�
     in	
�
     April	
�
    
2009, aimed to train participants on 
the principles and rules of gover-
nance. 
The	
�
     club	
�
     organized	
�
     a	
�
     seminar	
�
     in	
�
    

partnership	
�
     with	
�
     the	
�
     Ministry	
�
     of	
�
    
Industry	
�
     and	
�
     Trade,	
�
     which	
�
     was	
�
     held	
�
    
in	
�
     the	
�
     Sheraton	
�
     hotel	
�
     late	
�
     October	
�
    
2008	
�
    called,	
�
    “Closed	
�
    sharing	
�
    compa-
nies, and the importance of the tran-
sition to the open for public compa-
nies.”
The	
�
     club	
�
     organized	
�
     an	
�
     extensive	
�
    

training	
�
    program	
�
    in	
�
    October	
�
    2007	
�
    for	
�
    
human resources officials of the 
members’ companies.

The club is in the process of issu-
ing	
�
     the	
�
     Yemeni	
�
     Economic	
�
     Report,	
�
    
which is scheduled to be issued in 
2009 and then every two years. 
In	
�
     cooperation	
�
     with	
�
     the	
�
     Yemeni	
�
    

Polling	
�
    Center	
�
     and	
�
    CIPE,	
�
     it	
�
     is	
�
     work-
ing on a study on the current state of 
corporate	
�
    governance	
�
    in	
�
    Yemen.	
�
    
In	
�
     cooperation	
�
     with	
�
     CIPE,	
�
     KPMG	
�
    

was hired to conduct a study on the 
Yemeni	
�
     legislation	
�
     of	
�
     trade	
�
     and	
�
    
investment. 

The internal and external relations

The club has gained confidence and 
support from government, starting 
with	
�
     the	
�
     council	
�
     of	
�
     Minister	
�
     and	
�
     the	
�
    
Ministry	
�
    of	
�
    Planning	
�
    and	
�
    International	
�
    
Cooperation,	
�
     Ministry	
�
     of	
�
     Industry,	
�
    
General	
�
    Authority	
�
    for	
�
    Investment	
�
    and	
�
    
all other relevant government authori-
ties. 

Through participation in three suc-
cessive years, the club was able to 
get	
�
     International	
�
     Business	
�
     Forum	
�
     in	
�
    
2007	
�
    to	
�
    represent	
�
    Yemen.	
�
    

The club was able to open a good 
and fruitful relationship with the 
Center	
�
     for	
�
     International	
�
     Private	
�
    
Enterprise	
�
     of	
�
     the	
�
     Chamber	
�
     of	
�
    
Commerce,	
�
     in	
�
     Washington,	
�
     D.C.,	
�
    
beginning with a family businesses 
conference. 

The club was able work with the 
Association of the Turkish 
Businessmen	
�
    and	
�
    Industrialists.	
�
    

The club was able to establish a 
friendly relationship with the busi-
nessmen	
�
     of	
�
     Alexandria,	
�
     and	
�
     the	
�
    
Malaysian	
�
     Chamber	
�
     of	
�
     Commerce	
�
    
and	
�
     the	
�
     Organization	
�
     of	
�
     Turkish	
�
    
Tascon. 

The club maintains good relations 
with a number of regional and inter-
national embassies operating in 
Yemen.	
�
    

The club is linked to the General 
Union	
�
     of	
�
     Chambers	
�
     of	
�
     Commerce	
�
    
and	
�
     Industry	
�
     and	
�
     the	
�
     Businessmen	
�
    
Council	
�
    and	
�
    the	
�
    Yemeni	
�
    Industrialists	
�
    
Association. 

The club maintains a broad and 
strong relationship with many of the 
Yemeni	
�
    civil	
�
    society	
�
    organizations.	
�
    

The club was able to open pros-
pects for cooperation and friendship 
with	
�
    many	
�
    international	
�
    organizations	
�
    
working	
�
     in	
�
    Yemen,	
�
     such	
�
     as	
�
     IFC,	
�
     the	
�
    
World	
�
    Bank,	
�
    and	
�
    the	
�
    GTZ	
�
    .

The club has received several 
regional and international business 
delegations during their visits to 
Yemen.

About the Yemeni Businessmen Club

Ali	
�
    Al-­Azaki	
�
     is	
�
     the	
�
    executive	
�
    manager	
�
    of	
�
    
the	
�
     Yemeni	
�
     Businessmen	
�
     Club.	
�
     He	
�
     is	
�
    
currently completing his PhD on the 
inputs of marketing technologies on 
brand	
�
     equity,	
�
     after	
�
     graduating	
�
     in	
�
     2002	
�
    
from	
�
    Liverpool	
�
    University	
�
     in	
�
    UK	
�
     from	
�
    an	
�
    
MBA	
�
     course	
�
     through	
�
     a	
�
     Chevening	
�
    
Scholarship.	
�
     Since	
�
     his	
�
     graduation	
�
     he	
�
    
worked as the research and development 
manager	
�
     of	
�
     Al-­Amal	
�
     Microfinance	
�
     Bank	
�
    
and since the beginning of 2009 he 
changed careers to work at the 
Businessmen	
�
    Club	
�
    which	
�
    he	
�
    termed	
�
    as	
�
    a	
�
    
project with great potentials.
The	
�
    first	
�
    priority	
�
     for	
�
    Al-­Azaki	
�
     regarding	
�
    

the club is to create a general strategy to 
achieve	
�
     its	
�
     mission.	
�
     With	
�
     the	
�
     staff	
�
     and	
�
    
supervised by the board of directors he 
laid down a five year vision for the club 
and broke it down to annual plans.

“The	
�
     Businessmen	
�
     club	
�
     is	
�
     not	
�
     just	
�
     a	
�
    
place	
�
     for	
�
     socializing	
�
     and	
�
     entertainment	
�
    
whether	
�
     for	
�
     the	
�
    Yemeni	
�
     businessmen	
�
    or	
�
    
their	
�
    families.	
�
    It	
�
    is	
�
    a	
�
    place	
�
    for	
�
    exchanging	
�
    
expertise	
�
     and	
�
     personal	
�
     growth.	
�
    We	
�
    also	
�
    
plan to make it useful for its members 
through the provision of services such as 
working visas, filing applications on behalf 
of the members whether for local or inter-
national	
�
    authorities	
�
    and	
�
    so	
�
    on,”	
�
    he	
�
    said.
Currently	
�
     the	
�
     Businessmen	
�
     Club	
�
    

includes	
�
    104	
�
    Yemeni	
�
    businessmen	
�
     in	
�
     its	
�
    
membership list. The target is to double 
this number by the end of year 2010. The 
club has strong relations with various 
business and commercial institutes and 
has conducted several events through 
joint	
�
     ventures	
�
     such	
�
     as	
�
     the	
�
     Industry	
�
    
Conference	
�
     with	
�
     the	
�
     Chamber	
�
     of	
�
    
Commerce,	
�
     Privet	
�
     Sector	
�
     Governance	
�
    

and others. The most recent event was a 
seminar	
�
     in	
�
     July	
�
     on	
�
     the	
�
     global	
�
     develop-
ments and its impact on international 
trade.
Al-­Azaki	
�
    promises	
�
    to	
�
    make	
�
    the	
�
    club	
�
    an	
�
    

attractive	
�
     and	
�
     useful	
�
     place	
�
     for	
�
     Yemeni	
�
    
businessmen.	
�
    On	
�
    his	
�
     list	
�
    of	
�
     things	
�
     to	
�
    do	
�
    
is create new departments for research 
and business information database, 
entertainment activities for the families of 
the members, legislative advice for mem-
bers and facilitation of bilateral business 
cooperation.
“The	
�
     Yemeni	
�
     Businessmen	
�
     Club	
�
     was	
�
    

established	
�
     in	
�
     2003	
�
     as	
�
     a	
�
     not	
�
     for	
�
     profit	
�
    
NGO	
�
     to	
�
     bring	
�
     together	
�
     young,	
�
     educated	
�
    
and successful businessmen to advocate 
for greater economic reform and freedom 
in	
�
    Yemen.	
�
    The	
�
    YBC	
�
     is	
�
     the	
�
     only	
�
     alterna-
tive	
�
     organization	
�
     in	
�
     Yemen	
�
     to	
�
     the	
�
     tradi-

tional chambers of commerce and is con-
sulted	
�
    by	
�
     the	
�
    Yemeni	
�
    Government	
�
     regu-
larly regarding private sector issues. 
Elections	
�
    at	
�
    YBC	
�
    are	
�
    held	
�
    every	
�
    3	
�
    years,”	
�
    
he added. 

Yemeni Businessmen Club Executive Manager
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The TV and Radio General Corporation declared its interest in inviting for general bid number 
(16) with a hundred percent governmental funding for the year 2009 for:

Importing, fixing, licensing, testing, operating and guaranteeing two power 
generators for Sa’ada local broadcasting station.

All the interested importers and specialized companies must apply with their written request for 
this bid during the official work time to the following address:

 The TV and Radio General Corporation
 General Administration for Projects
 Tel: (01/ 230752)  

Cost for buying the bid documents (US$ 200) non refundable. 
The deadline of selling the documents is: 27/10/2009.

The bids must be presented in a red wax sealed envelopes to the bids and tenders committee's 
secretariat at the corporation. The names of the bidding company and of the project along with 
the tender number and the bidder's name must be written on the envelop, which should contain 
the following documents:
1. An unconditional bank guarantee of (US 2,500$) valid for 120 days as of the date of bid 

opening or a cashable check.
2. A copy of valid tax certificate for the year 2009 (feign bidders with no existing business 

activities in Yemen may furnish a copy of equivalent VAT registration document from their 
home countries). 

3. A copy of valid insurance certificate for the year 2009 (insurance certificate is required only 
from firms with employees in Yemen who are entitled to benefit from the Public Enterprise 
for Social Security in Yemen).

4. A copy of valid registration and classification for the year 2009.
5. A copy of valid Zakat certificate for the year 2009.
6. A copy of valid commercial registration valid for the year 2009.
7. A copy of valid profession license certificate for the year 2009.
8. A copy of valid sales tax registration certificate for the year 2009.
9. Interested applicants in this bid may review the tender documents before purchasing it during 

the official working hours for twenty days starting from the date of the first announcement

The deadline for receiving the proposals is at 11:00 am on Sunday 1/11/2009 at the corporation's 
main premises.

Invitation for General Bid 
No. (16) for the year 2009

The TV and Radio General Corporation declared its interest in inviting for general bid number 
(17) with a hundred percent governmental funding for the year 2009 for:

Importing, fixing, licensing, testing, operating and guaranteeing Tape less 
mobile TV cameras.

All the interested importers and specialized companies must apply with their written request for 
this bid during the official work time to the following address:

 The TV and Radio General Corporation
 General Administration for Projects
 Tel: (01/ 230752)  

Cost for buying the bid documents (US$ 100) non refundable. 
The deadline of selling the documents is: 27/10/2009.

The bids must be presented in a red wax sealed envelopes to the bids and tenders committee's 
secretariat at the corporation. The names of the bidding company and of the project along with 
the tender number and the bidder's name must be written on the envelop, which should contain 
the following documents:
1. An unconditional bank guarantee of (US 2,300$) valid for 120 days as of the date of bid 

opening or a cashable check.
2. A copy of valid tax certificate for the year 2009 (feign bidders with no existing business 

activities in Yemen may furnish a copy of equivalent VAT registration document from their 
home countries). 

3. A copy of valid insurance certificate for the year 2009 (insurance certificate is required only 
from firms with employees in Yemen who are entitled to benefit from the Public Enterprise 
for Social Security in Yemen).

4. A copy of valid registration and classification for the year 2009.
5. A copy of valid Zakat certificate for the year 2009.
6. A copy of valid commercial registration valid for the year 2009.
7. A copy of valid profession license certificate for the year 2009.
8. A copy of valid sales tax registration certificate for the year 2009.
9. Interested applicants in this bid may review the tender documents before purchasing it during 

the official working hours for twenty days starting from the date of the first announcement

The deadline for receiving the proposals is at 11:00 am on Sunday 1/11/2009 at the corporation's 
main premises.

Invitation for General Bid 
No. (17) for the year 2009

Invitation for 
Prequalification

Country: Republic of Yemen
Project: Dhamar – Alhussainiah Road Project Section II
1- Part (A1+ A2) Byt Alkabodi – Addan – Bani Muslim Branch- Souq 

Al-Thalooth  (51 Km)                      
2- Part (B1) Addan – Al-Nahia Branch- Souq Al Thalooth (24 Km)
3- Part (B2, B3) Souq Al-Thalooth- Bait Albaadani – Al-Mishrafa (40 Km)
                   In Dhamar Governorate, Republic of Yemen

Loan/Credit No: Loan. No.445/2003

The Government of the Republic of Yemen has received a Grant/Loan 
toward the cost of Dhamar – Alhussainiah Road Project Section II, and it 
intends to apply part of the proceeds of this [loan No.445/2003] to payments 
under the contract for construction of Dhamar – Alhussainiah Road Project 
Section II. The Ministry of Public Works and Highways intends to prequalify 
contractors for the construction of the above mentioned projects. The projects 
are:

1- Part (A1+ A2) Byt Alkabodi – Addan – Bani Muslim Branch- Souq 
Al-Thalooth  (51 Km) 

The typical cross section of the road consists 7.00 m paved single carriageway 
of 2 lanes and 2 x 1-1.5 m earth shoulders as shown in the Tender Drawings.  
The pavement thickness consists of 5 cm bituminous base course over 15 cm 
granular base course.
The project consists of the following major work items:

•	
�
     More	
�
    than	
�
    1,600,000.0	
�
    m3 of Earthwork
•	
�
     More	
�
    than	
�
    55,000	
�
    m3	
�
    of	
�
    Masonry	
�
    work	
�
    
•	
�
     More	
�
    than	
�
    174,000.0	
�
    m3 of sub-base and base course
•	
�
     More	
�
    than	
�
    18,	
�
    500.0	
�
    m3 of hot mix asphalt concrete

2- Part (B1) Addan – Al-Nahia Branch- Souq AlThalooth (24 Km)
The typical cross section of the road consists 7.00 m paved single carriageway 
of 2 lanes and 2 x 1-1.5 m earth shoulders as shown in the Tender Drawings.  
The pavement thickness consists of 5 cm bituminous base course over 15 cm 
granular base course.
The project consists of the following major work items:

•	
�
     More	
�
    than	
�
    1,300,000.0	
�
    m3 of Earthwork
•	
�
     More	
�
    than	
�
    23,000	
�
    m3	
�
    of	
�
    Masonry	
�
    work	
�
    
•	
�
     More	
�
    than	
�
    29,000.0	
�
    m3 of sub-base and base course
•	
�
     More	
�
    than	
�
    8,400.0	
�
    m3 of hot mix asphalt concrete

3- Part (B2, B3) Souq Al-Thalooth- BaitAlbaadani – Al-Mishrafa (40 Km)
The typical cross section of the road consists 7.00 m paved single carriageway 
of 2 lanes and 2 _ 1-1.5 m earth shoulders as shown in the Tender Drawings.  
The pavement thickness consists of 5 cm bituminous base course over 15 cm 
granular base course.
The project consists of the following major work items:

•	
�
     More	
�
    than	
�
    1,500,000.0	
�
    m3 of Earthwork
•	
�
     More	
�
    than	
�
    52,000	
�
    m3	
�
    of	
�
    Masonry	
�
    work	
�
    
•	
�
     More	
�
    than	
�
    71,000.0	
�
    m3 of sub-base and base course
•	
�
     More	
�
    than	
�
    14,	
�
    400.0	
�
    m3 of hot mix asphalt concrete

It is expected that invitations for bid will be made in Dec. 2009.
Prequalification will be conducted through prequalification procedures specified 
in the Guidelines for procurement of works for the borrowers of the Development 
Institutions,	
�
    Members	
�
     of	
�
     the	
�
    Cooperation	
�
    Group,	
�
     First	
�
     Edition,	
�
     1995, and is 
open	
�
    to	
�
    all	
�
    bidders	
�
    from	
�
    eligible	
�
    source	
�
    countries,	
�
    as	
�
    defined	
�
    in	
�
    the	
�
    guidelines.	
�
    
Interested eligible applicants may obtain further information from and inspect 
the prequalification document at the Ministry of Public Works and Highways 
from 8:30AM to2:00 PM, Saturday-Wednesday, at the address below. A 
complete set of the prequalification document in English may be obtained by 
interested applicants (a) on the submission of a written application to the 
address below at no charge , but a US$50.00 courier charges is required for  
overseas	
�
    delivery,	
�
    from	
�
    the	
�
    following	
�
    address: 

 Ministry of Public Works and Highways
 Internationally Funded Projects Implementation Unit (IFPIU)
 Nuqum, Next to Berlin Public Park
 MPWH Head Offices Building, 3rd Floor
 Sana’a, Republic of Yemen
 Tel: + 967 1 545164
 Fax: + 967 1 546134
 Email: ifrpiu@yemen.net.ye 
 Attention:  The Director,IFPIU, MPWH

The deadline for application submission is: 11:00 AM, Wed.11 Nov., 2009
Applications	
�
     for	
�
     prequalification	
�
     should	
�
     be	
�
     submitted	
�
     in	
�
     sealed	
�
     envelopes,	
�
    
delivered to the address above by 11:00 AM, Wed.11 Nov.,2009, and be clearly 
marked “Application to Prequalify for “ The Construction of Dhamar – 
Alhussainiah Road Project Section II.”
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VACANCY
Administrative Assistant 

CARE has an immediate vacancy for an Administrative Assistant, 
based in its Sana’a Office. The person will be a member of the 
CARE administration team.  They will undertake and complete all 
administration tasks and requirements, provide office and support 
services to staff and projects, in addition to implementing 
administration team projects.  Other responsibilities include: 
Reception and secretarial duties;  Handling petty cash; filing; 
typing and document reproduction; Special events coordination 
and logistics; manage office supplies and equipment.

Person Specification
Fluent in spoken and written English and Arabic• 
Excellent computer skills• 
Experience in filing and safeguarding important documents• 
Experience in managing and reconciling petty cash • 
Minimum educational attainment is a graduate of secondary • 
school 

To apply send a CV to, 68 Arwa School street or email
vacancy@careyemen.org with the subject heading “Administrative 
Assistant Vacancy”.  Application deadline is Friday 16th October 
2009. Only short listed candidates will be contacted.

By: Christian Gross
Trident Press Ltd

Faced with the challenge of 
bringing prosperity and 
development to the country 
in such a way that the envi-
ronmental impact is kept to 

a minimum, the Yemen government is 
actively pursuing several policy 
strands. The driving force behind 
Yemen’s conservation drive is the 
Environment Protection Council. One 
of its directors, Nagi Saleh al Towabeh 
visited Sharjah for the second 
Conservation meeting held at the 
Breeding Centre for Endangered 
Arabian Wildlife where he met with 
Abdulaziz Abdullah al Midfa, Director 
General of the Environment and 
Protected Areas Authority. A memo-
randum of understanding for coopera-
tion in the field of conservation 
between Sharjah and Yemen was 
signed and thus the “Bab al Yemen” 
was opened for a team from Animal 
Management Consultancy to visit the 
country.

As a first effort it was decided to 
target animal welfare in the two exist-
ing zoos, in Sana’a and in Ta’iz, which 
meant that staff veterinarian, Florine 
de Haas van Dorsser and myself 

organised two trips to Yemen during 
March and April, 2001. Despite their 
small size it is clear that considerable 
resources have been devoted to the 
creation of these facilities. We have 
often been asked if we think that it can 
be justified that a developing country 
(where there are only 28 televisions 
per 1000 inhabitants) spends money on 
a zoo. We believe that it is. People 
want, need and seek distraction, which 
is the reason why both places prove to 
be enormously popular. This in turn 
makes them marvelous tools for 
enhancing public awareness and pro-
moting conservation. 

We found two very interesting zoo 
collections consisting mainly of 
Arabian animals. In an attempt to help 
the Arabian leopard, the government 
took the known animals into their 
facilities and the two zoos today have 
a total of 15 leopards, of which five 
were captive bred. All of these have 
been micro-chipped, measured, 
weighed, given a general health check 
and samples were taken for DNA anal-
ysis. They were all entered into the 
International Arabian Leopard 
Studbook. With the agreement of the 
Yemeni Government to exchange these 
animals for breeding loans, the genetic 

stock for a sustainable captive-breed-
ing program is almost secured. 
At present both zoos lack proper 
breeding facilities for the Arabian 
leopards, the females tending to kill 
their progeny due to too much distur-
bance. The solution Taiz zoo found for 
this problem was to time the pregnan-
cy of a female dog (bitch) in such a 
way that her delivery coincided with 
the birth of the baby leopards. The 
leopard cubs and dog puppies are then 
switched between parents. It is certain-
ly an ingenious approach to the prob-
lem, although at present plans are 
being drawn up in order to improve 
upon this situation; not only because 
these dog-raised leopard cubs may 
prove unsuitable for the breeding pro-
gram, but more specifically to improve 
the living conditions for the parents. 
In both zoos the only exotic wildlife to 
be found were a number of lions with 
unusual histories. Transferred to the 
zoos from the old Imam’s Palaces, the 
lions from Sana’a zoo are said to be 
descendants of animals that were wild-
caught in Yemen! Hard to believe, but 
samples were taken for genetic work at 
a later stage. Evidence of lions living 
in the Arabian peninsula can be found 
in the preserved writings of a Greek 
scholar, Agatharhides of Cnidus, who 

described a wadi in NW Arabia where 
local residents protected their animals 
against roving lions (see box). Taiz zoo 
also has some very handsome lions 
with the males sporting abnormally 
dense manes, which extend along their 
chests and cover the animal’s bellies. 
They are said to be descendants of 
lions given to the Imam in 1952 by 
Emperor Haile Selassie of Ethiopia. 
One of these female lions had an 
infected claw and needed to be operat-
ed on, which provided us the opportu-
nity to take more blood samples for 
analysis. Since she had cubs and was 
lactating, a milk sample was also 
taken. Besides milking lionesses, the 

main aim at the first stage was to de-
worm and vaccinate all the carnivorous 
animals. Over 100 vaccines were given 
to a wide range of small animals such 
as foxes, honey badgers, mongoose 
and genets housed at Sana’a and Taiz 
zoos.

As we finished our work a day ear-
lier than expected in Taiz, we decided 
to take the long road back to Sana’a 
via the coastal town of Al Hodeidah. 
Whilst on the road we indulged in 
some ad-hoc bird watching and 
observed Abdim’s stork, Abyssinian 
roller, African grey hornbill and dark 
chanting goshawk.

In the early morning in Al Hodeidah 
we visited the local fish market. Never 
have I seen so many sharks in one 
place! We were informed that two to 
three tones of shark alone came 
through Al Hodeidah every day, with 
the money being made on the fins. I 
have serious doubts if this is sustain-
able.

As a final bonus to a fascinating 
trip, a Bruce’s green pigeon visited the 
back garden of the Taj Sheba Hotel in 
Sana’a. We felt very privileged to have 
seen so many species and to have met 
so many wonderful people on our short 
working visit to the Yemen.

Zoo mission to Yemen
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Shall we reveal our feelings to 
others with words or actions?

By: Maged Thabet Alkholidy
majed_thabet@hotmail.com

Human beings establish 
relations with others 
on the basis of the feel-
ings they have towards 
others. Generally, the 

kind of relationhips that everyone has 
with others reflects the feelings of the 

person towards the other. Some peo-
ple always try to reveal such feelings 

by frankly talking or writing about 
them to show what kind of feeling 
they have. 

However, I am against the idea of 
using words to express one's feelings, 
and personally, I think actions can be 

used indirectly to better show such 

feeling, without leaving any doubts. 
Actually, people may start deal 

with each other without identifying 

any kind of feelings. But, in time, 
everyone starts drawing an outline of 
his or her feeling towards each other. 

These feelings develop themselves 
either positively or negatively, and 
can be expressed with words or ac-
tions accordingly. 

In the case if negative feelings like 

hatred or disgust, expressing feelings 
frankly by words is really offensive. 
If one person hates another one, it is a 
matter of insult if he tells him face to 

his face, "I hate you." 

Regarding this point, I do not mean 
it is better to do harmful actions to the 

other one to show him his or her ha-
tred, but it is better to avoid contact-
ing him at all. 

The idea which I want to focus on 

in this article is the how to express 

the positive feelings among people, 
especially the feeling of love. What I 

think is that it is better to express love 
by actions rather than by words for 

some reasons that negatively effects 

the relations among persons if words 
are used to express such feeling. 

The first reason behind my opinion 

is the kind of sensitivity that results 
when one of the parties express his 
feeling with words. If two persons, 
for example, deal as friends with each 

other, they try to do all what they can 

to make each other happy and com-
fortable. Expressing such feeling with 

words makes each one expect great 

things.
In case one of them does not do 

any of the expected actions to make 

the other happy or comfortable, the 

other person will easily get sensitive 
or sometimes angry. 

As a result, one or maybe the two 
may reconsider whether the words 

used to express the love by the other 
are real or not. 

That is, he or she may think that 
the other person was not serious, or 
maybe lying. Because of this, the re-
lation between such two persons may 

get disturbed and may end. 
Expressing the feeling of love be-

tween the two people with words 
weakens relationships. If one of 
them, for example, expresses his feel-
ing with words, he or she will be less 
motivated to express that feeling with 
actions. 

He or she will think that his or her 
love is already expressed with words 
so that the deeds will be less and 
less.

One of the means of expressing re-
lations among people with words is 
naming their relations. Naming the re-
lations, I think, also negatively affects 

the relations among them. It limits the 
relations between them. That is to say, 
if two persons name their relation as 
"colleagues," their relationship will 

only be as colleagues, and they will 

be unable to expand it to friendship. 
Without naming human relations, 

on the other hand, people can mould 

and expand their relations accord-
ing to the feelings they have. That is, 
they can start as colleagues, then as 

friends, and then it may reach to love 

relationship, especially if they belong 

to two genders. 
In my opinion, expressing rela-

tions between people with deeds and 
actions are better than words, as the 

proverb says, actions speak louder 

that words, and here also actions 

strengthen the human relations, while 
words weaken them. 

This is a personal opinion, and you 
have your own opinions, dear readers. 
I hope to receive your comments and 

your viewpoints. 

Maged Thabet Al-Kholidy is a con-

tributing opinion writer from Taiz. 

He holds an MA in English, and is 

the former editor of Taiz University’s 

English-language magazine.

By: Naji Gazali 
naji734@gmail.com

I listened to the president’s speech 

and dissected it piece by piece. 

And my humble conclusion 

was that he, the president, is 
willing to destroy anything in 

order to maintain his post but most im-
portantly to pass on his post safely to 
his waiting, impatient son. I hope I am 
wrong, but let me share with you why I 
reached this conclusion. 

Saleh kept reminding  us throughout 
his speech that Yemenis in general and 

those of us in the opposition in particu-
lar, must stand behind him blindly, be-
cause HE is Yemen itself, and if you are 

a Yemeni you must save HIM because 

without HIM there will be no Yemen. 

In a simpler note, if you oppose me 
in anything, then you are not Yemenis. 

As much as I oppose this president, 

my opposition to him has reached its 

height. A complete change in the lead-
ership of Yemen is the only solution to 

save Yemen. 

Besides, his arrogant attitude to-
wards the opposition parties continues 

to destroy the unity of Yemenis and 

their multiparty system’s inputs and 
responsibility to the problems that is 
facing Yemen. Yet he keeps bragging 

about the old slogan that Yemen belong 

to all Yemenis. 

When the facts suggest otherwise, I 

bet you Mr. President your electricity 

has never been interrupted like mine on 
daily basis, so how can you say that Ye-
men belongs to all of us? It only belongs 
to you, and the fortunate ones in your 
circle and those who knew how to clap 

their hands when you gave speeches  or 

whenever your name was mentioned. 
According to your definition I am not 

a Yemeni. But I am one of those who 

have lost sight of future in this country 

because of you.  

The president said that Yemen is fac-
ing three obstacles or major problems 

that are hindering its development, 
(Al-Huthis, Alqada, and the economy), 

I may add the fourth one and that is 
(government’s corruption). 

So was he accurate about his analy-
sis of what is really hindering and de-
stroying our country’s development. I 

will differ with him in prioritize these 
obstacles. 

To me number one will be the econ-
omy because if your economy is weak 

or dead, you can’t solve any of the 

above. But what has caused our presi-
dent to admit a failed economy situa-
tion in Yemen? Remember what his ad-
visor Al-Irayni said already, that Yemen 

is heading towards starvation, now the 
president himself admits it and that he 

has failed at least economically.

Yet he wants us to continue support-
ing him! If he claimed that we are a 

democratic country, then he should be 

voted out or impeached instead of be-
ing supported. 

But he was not able to fellow up his 
confession of economic failure or to 

take responsibility for it. Instead he im-
mediately said that economy is not the 

economy of the Al-Motemer’s which 

is the ruling party’s fault, rather it is 
our economy, meaning that it is all our 

fault. 
So, Mr. President you cannot 

just claim success to you or your gov-
ernment and want us to be responsible 
for your failures. Mr. President, I hold 

you responsible for every misery in Ye-
men and you alone should worry about 
what will happen if Yemen collapses 

into ruins and starvation as you and 
your political and economical advisor 

Mr. Al-Irayni predicated. 

And as the old saying goes (3asie-
datak Matanaha) which could be trans-
lated loosely (when you cook a meal, 

it is you the cook, who must fix it) and 

please never ask us to put our touches 

on it, or to be responsible for its taste. 
Unless we collectively take our re-
sponsibility to change the direction of 

our country, we too deserve to be con-
demned as well.

47th anniversary's last speech!

By: Gary Vey
info@willsinn.com

T en years ago I visited Ye-
men for the first time. 
This was months before 
the attacks on America's 

World Trade Center and 

before there was any real threat of ter-
rorism. I came at the invitation of the 

Yemeni government to document and 

promote tourism, and also to access 

the tremendous potential that Yemen 

had as a top historical and religious 

site -- even surpassing Egypt and the 
great pyramids. 

You see, the writing on the walls 

of the palace of Sheba in Mareb tells 

a story that the great Ark of the Cov-
enant, mentioned in the Bible and Holy 
Qu'ran, was buried there. At the time 
the great wall, surrounding the buried 
chamber, was uncovered by the Uni-
versity of Calgary. I translated some of 

this revealing script and was invited to 

see it for myself. 
This site could have transformed 

Yemen to a world class tourist desti-
nation, surpassing even Egypt. It could 

have validated the Qu'ran and biblical 

accounts of history. Indeed, if the Ark 
is still there, it could provide a direct 

link to the Creator, Allah. But what has 
happened to Yemen since? 

Why has there been such a dete-
rioration and in-fighting among tribal 
groups? Why has the great destiny 

already established been delayed by 
petty vendettas and politics? Is this 

perhaps the work of the devil himself?
The text on the wall prophesized 

that Yemen would become the greatest 

and most important land once the truth 

of what is buried in Mareb was discov-
ered. "The least of all should become 

the most important." 

But perhaps the secret that remained 

buried for 3000 yeåars must yet wait 
more eons of time, so that the people 
who inhabit the region can remember 

their special destiny. 

Yemen ten years ago and today

1.	
�
    Finncial	
�
    officer	
�
    postion
Key	
�
    responsiblitie	
�
    sof	
�
    this	
�
    postion	
�
    are	
�
    as	
�
    follows:

i.	
�
     Ensure	
�
     that	
�
     the	
�
     financial	
�
     and	
�
     caccounting	
�
     manual	
�
     of	
�
    
policies	
�
     and	
�
     procedures	
�
     is	
�
     approperiately	
�
     applied	
�
     in	
�
    
managing	
�
    the	
�
    project	
�
    funds;;

ii.	
�
     Implement	
�
     and	
�
     manage	
�
     the	
�
     financial	
�
     and	
�
     accounting	
�
    
systems	
�
    of	
�
    the	
�
    Project;;

iii.	
�
     Prepare	
�
     the	
�
     quarterly	
�
     interim	
�
     financial	
�
     reports	
�
     of	
�
     the	
�
    
project	
�
    and	
�
    analyze	
�
    the	
�
    variances	
�
    when	
�
    compared	
�
    to	
�
    the	
�
    
project	
�
    budget;;

iv.	
�
     Prepare	
�
    annual	
�
    project	
�
    financial	
�
    statements	
�
    and	
�
    submit	
�
    
these	
�
    for	
�
    audit;;

v.	
�
     Monitor	
�
    the	
�
    internal	
�
    control	
�
    system	
�
    to	
�
    ensure	
�
    compliance	
�
    
with	
�
    the	
�
    agreed	
�
    mechanisms,	
�
    procedures,	
�
    and	
�
    systems;;

vi.	
�
     Preparing	
�
    the	
�
    yearly	
�
    budget	
�
    of	
�
    the	
�
    project	
�
    in	
�
    cooperation	
�
    
with	
�
     the	
�
     other	
�
    members	
�
     of	
�
     the	
�
     PST,	
�
     the	
�
     implementing	
�
    
agency	
�
    and	
�
    the	
�
    World	
�
    Bank;;

vii.	
�
     Prepare	
�
    disbursement	
�
    schedules	
�
    and	
�
    financial	
�
    forecasts	
�
    
for	
�
    the	
�
    project;;

viii.	
�
    Verify	
�
     payments	
�
     to	
�
     ensure	
�
     that	
�
     the	
�
     expenditures	
�
     have	
�
    
been	
�
    properly	
�
    budgeted,	
�
    authorized	
�
    and	
�
    recodrded;;	
�
    the	
�
    
sums	
�
    extended	
�
    should	
�
    follow	
�
    the	
�
    allocation	
�
    category	
�
    for	
�
    
vairous	
�
    activities;;

ix.	
�
     Manage	
�
    the	
�
    case	
�
    accounts	
�
    designated	
�
    for	
�
    project	
�
    use	
�
    to	
�
    
ensure	
�
    the	
�
    efficient	
�
    use	
�
    of	
�
    funds,	
�
    through	
�
    following	
�
    up	
�
    on	
�
    
the	
�
    signed	
�
    contracts	
�
    and	
�
    all	
�
    committed	
�
    funds;;

x.	
�
     Communicate	
�
     and	
�
     cooperate	
�
     with	
�
     the	
�
     project	
�
     external	
�
    
auditor	
�
     and	
�
     the	
�
     government	
�
     audit	
�
     bureau;;	
�
     and	
�
     other	
�
    
related	
�
    agencies	
�
    as	
�
    needed;;

xi.	
�
     Perform	
�
     any	
�
     other	
�
     project-­related	
�
     duties	
�
     requested	
�
     by	
�
    
the	
�
    Head	
�
    of	
�
    the	
�
    PST.

Qualifications	
�
    and	
�
    Desired	
�
    Exprience

In	
�
     order	
�
     to	
�
     fulfill	
�
     the	
�
     described	
�
     responsbilities,	
�
     the	
�
     MoPIC	
�
    
needs	
�
    to	
�
    contract	
�
    a	
�
    National	
�
    Consultant	
�
    with	
�
    the	
�
    following	
�
    
requirements:

•	
�
     A	
�
    minimum	
�
    of	
�
    a	
�
    Bachelor's	
�
    degree	
�
    in	
�
    accounting	
�
    with	
�
    at	
�
    
least	
�
    Yemeni	
�
    CPA/CA	
�
    designation;;

•	
�
     At	
�
     least	
�
     5	
�
     years	
�
     experience	
�
     working	
�
     with	
�
     financial	
�
    
planning	
�
     and	
�
     accounting	
�
     systems,	
�
     and	
�
     preferably	
�
     with	
�
    
WB	
�
    financed	
�
    projects	
�
    and/or	
�
    auditing	
�
    firm;;	
�
     knkowledge	
�
    
and	
�
    experfience	
�
    of	
�
    office	
�
    administrative	
�
    functions;;

•	
�
     KNowledge	
�
     and	
�
     practical	
�
     experience	
�
     with	
�
     computers	
�
    
(e.g.	
�
     Windows	
�
     software	
�
     applications	
�
     (Word,	
�
     Excel,	
�
    
PowerPoint,	
�
     Internet)	
�
     and	
�
     special	
�
     accounting	
�
     software	
�
    
applications	
�
    is	
�
    requiered).

•	
�
     The	
�
     ability	
�
     to	
�
     translate	
�
     planned	
�
     activities	
�
     into	
�
     concrete	
�
    
budgets,	
�
     establish	
�
     standard	
�
     unit	
�
     costs,	
�
     and	
�
     analyze	
�
    
and	
�
     report	
�
     them	
�
     for	
�
     the	
�
     purpose	
�
     of	
�
     recommending	
�
    
impprovements	
�
    in	
�
    operations;;

•	
�
     The	
�
     ability	
�
     to	
�
     supervise	
�
     accounting	
�
     and	
�
     other	
�
     inancial	
�
    

functions	
�
    and	
�
     report	
�
     financial	
�
     information	
�
    usable	
�
     to	
�
     the	
�
    
various	
�
     stakeholders:	
�
     Government,	
�
     World	
�
     Bank,	
�
     and	
�
    
auditors;;

•	
�
     Communicate	
�
     well	
�
     in	
�
     written	
�
     and	
�
     spoken	
�
     English	
�
     and	
�
    
Arabic	
�
    Languages.

Duration:

The	
�
    assignment	
�
    will	
�
    be	
�
    for	
�
    1	
�
    year,	
�
    renewable	
�
    annually.

2.	
�
    Procurement	
�
    Officer
Key	
�
    Responsibilities	
�
    of	
�
    this	
�
    postion	
�
    are	
�
    as	
�
    follows:
-­	
�
     Obtain	
�
     the	
�
     technical	
�
     specifications,	
�
     bill	
�
     of	
�
     quantities	
�
    

and	
�
    other	
�
    data,	
�
    and	
�
    prepare	
�
    the	
�
    bidding	
�
    documents	
�
    for	
�
    
the	
�
     procurement	
�
     of	
�
     goods	
�
     and	
�
    works	
�
     under	
�
     the	
�
    World	
�
    
Bank's	
�
    procurement	
�
    guidelines	
�
    for	
�
    goods,	
�
    works	
�
    and	
�
    non	
�
    
consulting	
�
    services.

-­	
�
     Handle	
�
     the	
�
     selection	
�
     process	
�
     of	
�
     the	
�
     implementing	
�
    
agency.

-­	
�
     Perpare	
�
    all	
�
     pocurement	
�
    documents	
�
    financed	
�
    under	
�
     the	
�
    
project.

-­	
�
     Follw	
�
    the	
�
    procurement	
�
    plan	
�
    as	
�
    given	
�
    in	
�
    the	
�
    project.
-­	
�
     Follow	
�
    up	
�
    on	
�
    all	
�
     instructions	
�
    by	
�
    the	
�
    project	
�
    director	
�
    and	
�
    

regularly	
�
     update	
�
     the	
�
     Procurement	
�
     Plan	
�
     for	
�
     all	
�
     project	
�
    
related	
�
    issues.

-­	
�
     Develop	
�
     a	
�
     close	
�
     team	
�
     spirit	
�
     among	
�
     the	
�
     colleagues	
�
     in	
�
    
PST	
�
    and	
�
    related	
�
    staff	
�
    in	
�
    the	
�
    Implmenting	
�
    Agency	
�
    and	
�
    the	
�
    
World	
�
    Bank.

-­	
�
     Prepare	
�
    the	
�
    expression	
�
    of	
�
    interest	
�
    (EOI).

Qualifications	
�
    and	
�
    desired	
�
    experience:

In	
�
     order	
�
     to	
�
     fulfill	
�
     the	
�
     described	
�
     responsibilities,	
�
     the	
�
     MoPIC	
�
    
needs	
�
     to	
�
     contract	
�
     a	
�
     national	
�
     consultant	
�
     with	
�
     the	
�
     following	
�
    
requirements:
-­	
�
    A	
�
    minimum	
�
    of	
�
    a	
�
    bachelor's	
�
    degree	
�
    in	
�
    Engineering,	
�
    finance,	
�
    
Law,	
�
    other	
�
    related	
�
    field.
-­	
�
     At	
�
     least	
�
     5	
�
     years	
�
     experience	
�
     working	
�
     with	
�
     procurement	
�
    
planning	
�
     and	
�
     accounting	
�
     systems,	
�
     and	
�
     preferably	
�
    with	
�
    WB	
�
    
financed	
�
     projects	
�
     and	
�
     /or	
�
     auditing	
�
     firm;;	
�
     knowledge	
�
     and	
�
    
experience	
�
    of	
�
    office	
�
    adminsitrative	
�
    functions.
-­	
�
     Understanding	
�
     the	
�
     procurement	
�
     procedures	
�
     under	
�
     public	
�
    
procurement	
�
    regulations	
�
    of	
�
    the	
�
    Government	
�
    of	
�
    Yemen	
�
    (GoY)	
�
    
and	
�
     the	
�
     Procurement	
�
     Procedures/Documents	
�
     of	
�
     the	
�
    World	
�
    
Bank.
-­	
�
     Knowledge	
�
     and	
�
     practical	
�
     experine	
�
     with	
�
     computers	
�
     (e.g.	
�
    
Windows	
�
     software	
�
     applications	
�
     (Word,	
�
     Excel,	
�
     PowerPoint,	
�
    
Internet)).
-­	
�
    Good	
�
    Communication	
�
    Skills,	
�
    	
�
    both	
�
    written	
�
    and	
�
    oral	
�
    in	
�
    English	
�
    
and	
�
    Arabic.

Duration:

The	
�
    assignment	
�
    will	
�
    be	
�
    for	
�
    1	
�
    year,	
�
    reneably	
�
    annually.

Ministry of Planning and International Coperation
Recruitment	
�
   of	
�
   Financial	
�
   and	
�
   Procurement	
�
   Officers

Request for Expressions of Interest
The	
�
    Government	
�
    of	
�
    Yemen	
�
    is	
�
    initiating	
�
    a	
�
    pilot	
�
    (financed	
�
    by	
�
    the	
�
    Japanese	
�
    social	
�
    fund	
�
    for	
�
    development	
�
    &	
�
    administered	
�
    by	
�
    the	
�
    
World	
�
    Bank)	
�
    which	
�
    will	
�
    help	
�
    promote	
�
    self-­employment	
�
    for	
�
    young	
�
    people	
�
    in	
�
    areas	
�
    with	
�
    low	
�
    or	
�
    negligible	
�
    labor	
�
    demand.
The	
�
    Ministry	
�
    of	
�
    Planning	
�
    and	
�
    International	
�
    Cooperation	
�
    (MoPIC)	
�
    invites	
�
    eligible	
�
    persons	
�
    interested	
�
    in	
�
    the	
�
    financial	
�
    officer	
�
    
position	
�
    and	
�
    procurement	
�
    officer	
�
    position	
�
    of	
�
    the	
�
    pilot.	
�
    Persons	
�
    must	
�
    provide	
�
    information	
�
    indicating	
�
    that	
�
    they	
�
    are	
�
    qualified	
�
    
to	
�
    perform	
�
    the	
�
    serviceswand	
�
    experience	
�
    in	
�
    similar	
�
    assignment.
Interestted	
�
    consultants	
�
    may	
�
    obtain	
�
    further	
�
    information	
�
    during	
�
    working	
�
    days	
�
    Sat.	
�
    -­	
�
    Wed.	
�
    from	
�
    10:00	
�
    AM	
�
    to	
�
    3:00	
�
    PM	
�
    at	
�
    the	
�
    
address	
�
    below	
�
    to	
�
    which	
�
    the	
�
    expression	
�
    of	
�
    interst	
�
    must	
�
    be	
�
    delivered	
�
    within	
�
    two	
�
    weeks	
�
    from	
�
    this	
�
    advertisement	
�
    date,	
�
    by	
�
    
project	
�
    coordinator	
�
    at	
�
    MoPIC,	
�
    Ms.	
�
    Nabila	
�
    Al0Jarafee,	
�
    Ministry	
�
    of	
�
    Planning	
�
    and	
�
    International	
�
    Cooperation,	
�
    Hurria	
�
    Stret,	
�
    PO	
�
    
Box	
�
    175,	
�
    Email:	
�
    njerafee@yahoo.com,	
�
    Fax:	
�
    239703

Through
The Mind’s Eye



باحثون عن وظيفة 

طبيب  مساعد  عالي  دبلوم   - علي  •أنور 
- يجيد التعامل مع  الحاسوب والانترنيت 

-خبرة في تدريس الاسعافات الأولية

للتواصل: 770649791-777488132

• بكالريوس حاسوب - خبرة في تصميم 
برنامج  باستخدام  الانظمة  تحليل  و 

اوراكل

للتواصل: 770200774- 713976358

 - انجليزية  لغة  بكالوريوس   - •عليان 
التدريس - يرغب  خبرة ثلاث سنوات في 

في العمل في اي معهد او شركة نفطية

للتواصل: 713232452

كمبيوتر-  هندسة   - علي  •معتصم 
لغة  دبلوم  الكمبيوتر -  دورات في صيانة 

انجليزية)الهند(

للتواصل: 735414140

 - الجنسية  جوفيد-هندي  ماثيور   •
ماجستير تجارة - خبرة أكثر من عشرين 

 - الإدارة   - التجارة  مجال  في  سنة 

تسويق - مشاريع

للتواصل: 711445254 

 - محاسبة  بكالوريوس   - •نشوان 
العمل  في  سنوات  ثلاث  من  لاكثر  خبرة 

الإنجليزية  للغة  ا يجيد   - المحاسبي 

يرغب   - الكمبيوتر  واستخدام  والترجمة 

في العمل في آي شركة

للتواصل: 771580509

بكالوريوس   - علي  محمود   •
محاسبة - خمس سنوات خبرة 

في العمل على نظام يمن سوفت

للتواصل: 770490514

 - لم  سا جميل  عد  ر •
اتصالات  هندسة  بكالوريوس 

لغة  بلوم  د  - نيات  لكترو ا و

كمبيوتر   دورات   - إنجليزية 

 - IC3
للتواصل: 777218926

بكالوريوس   - فضل  •وضاح 
علوم وهندسة كمبيوتر - دورات 

برمجة  و نة  صيا ل  مجا في 

الكمبيوتر في أكثر من شركة - 

 )CISCO CCNA شبكات  شهادات 

- جيد جداً في اللغة الإنجليزية - نشيط 

ومجتهد

للتواصل: 734131171

دبلوم   - إنجليزية  لغة  بكالوريوس   •
العمل  يجيد   - والإدارة  المبيعات  في 

واالمناقصات  التجارية  المراسلات  في 

والتعاملات التجارية

للتواصل:  ٧٣3826769

العامري   - هندسة معلوماتية  • محمد 
 - تشغيل  ونظم  حاسوبية  شبكات   -

 - سوريا   - اللاذقية   - تشرين  جامعة 

يجيد اللغة الإنجليزية

للتواصل: 73٥671825

•سامي محمد - هنسة معلوماتية - قسم 
جامعة   - الحاسوبية  والشبكات  النظم 

تشرين اللاذقية - سوريا

للتواصل: 7339690٩٢

لغة  بكالوريوس   - خميس  ناجي   •
الحاسوب  مع  التعامل  يجيد   - إنجليزية 

والإنترنيت خبرة سنة ونصف كنائب مدير 

يرغب   - العالمية  هوك  شركة  في  إداري 

في العمل في أي شركة أو مدرسة

للتواصل:712837559

 - حاسوب  هندسة  لوريوس  بكا  •
برمجة  دبلوم   - الجنسية(  )فلسطيني 

حاسوب - خبرة عشر سنوات في تدريس 

تدريس  على  قادر   - الكمبيوتر  مواد 

الإنجليزية  باللغة  والفيزياء  الرياضيات 

في  العمل  في  يرغب   - الثانوية  للمرحلة 

أي مكان

للتواصل: 733803194

عقارات

غرف   4 من  مكونة  شقة  •للإيجار: 
بجانب  الموقع   - وصالتين  وحمامين 

فندق الجامعة الجديدة

للتواصل: 777410098

لمستشفى  ا خلف  فيلا  ر  للإيجا  •
بدروم،  مع  دورين  الالماني  السعودي 

مطب  مع  حمامات  وخمس  غرف  خمس 

امريكي  دولار   1200 فقط  كبير  وحوش 

شهريا. للتواصل ايميل

 hmustafa4@gmail.com
قم  بر ل  تصا لا ا و  ا  

امريكي0017343419969

الحي  الموقع:   - كبيرة  فيلا  •للإيجار: 
السياسي - المدرسة الفرنسية سابقاً

للإستفسار: 771799147

سيارات

بيع  عن  الباكستانية  السفارة  تعلن   •
 -  200٠ موديل  بنز  مرسيدس  سيارة 

المسافة   - جيدة  وبحالة  اللون  بيضاء 

المقطوعة 154800كم. للمعاينة في مبنى 

الساعة  مابين  العمل  أيام  خلال  السفارة 

تقدم  مساءاً.  والخامسة  التاسعة صباحاً 

يوم  مغلقة  مظاريف  السعرفي  عروض 

10/2٠٠٩/1١

للتواصل: 248814 - 248866 

إعلانات مبوبة 158 October 2009

طوارىء الكهرباء 177، طوارىء الشرطه 199، 

الإطفاء 191، طوارىء المياه 171، 
الإستعلامات 118، حوادث )المرور( 194، 

الشئون الخارجيه 202544/7، الشئون الداخليه 252701/7، الهجرة 
250761/3، وزارة المواصلات )تلفون( 7522202، 

 الإذاعة 282061، التلفزيون 332001/2،
مؤسسة الباصات للتنقل داخل المدن 262111/3، 

وزارة المواصلات 325110/1/2/3، السياحه 254032، 
  الصليب الاحمر 203131/3، تليمن 7522227

           

البنوك $             
بنك اليمن والخليج        فاكس:260824  ت: 967-1-260823

فرع عدن :ت/ 237829- 2. فاكس/237824

بنك التضامن الإسلامي  ت: 01/666666 

البنك التجاري       ت: 277224    فاكس : 277291

مصرف اليمن البحرين الشامل      ت: 264775,264702

                                    فاكس: 264703,503350

بنك اليمن الدولي            ت: 407030 -01       

البنك العربي                ت:  276585/2 -01

بنك التسليف الزراعي       ت : 01-563813

البنك المركزي:             ت: 274314 -01 

تأجير سيارات v

زاويه ) Budget( ت: 3096180506372   فاكس: 240958

يورب كار    ت: 270751               فاكس: 270804

هيرتز لتآجير السيارات   صنعاء    ت: 01-440309

                                    فرع شيراتون  ت: 545985              

                                   عدن  ت :02-245625 

                     
مراكز تدريب وتعليم الكمبيوتر

آبتك لتعليم الكمبيوتر)تركيز على الانترنت، مناهج، تجارة إلكترونية( 
  

شهادة ايزو 1.                     

                                 صنعاء  ت: 01-468305

                                   فاكس : 407419 - 01 

 	                  عدن ت: 20-237199    

	                  تعز ت: 04-250343 

                                   المكلاء ت: 05-307492

        	    

Infinit Education        T :444553         

ت: 445518/7-442073 NIIT   لتعليم الكمبيوتر	

           	  

           	
البريد السريع

       صنعاء     ت: 440170/228/23٠    

		 	            عدن       ت 24562٦

                              الحديده    ت: 226975/4	                              

إب         ت: 411988

         	            المكلا      ت: 302641 

                              شبوه       ت: 202326

         	            سيئون     ت: 407219

                               تعز       ت:260500

                              بلحاف     ت: 777788660                                      

سقطرى    ت: 660498

  
 DHL :441099/8/7/6 

   أرامكس   صنعاء    ت: 441024/5

         عدن   ت:243124    تعز    ت: 213489  

        المكلا  ت: 309190   الحديدة ت: 219643

 T      شحن وتوصيل
M&M Logistics & Aviation Services 
               Tel : 01-531221/531231

النسيم للشحن والتوصيل        ت: 407905

ت:1-444550،441935 		 ورلد لينك 

مستشفيات +

مستشفى الثورة         ت: 01/246967-66

المستشفى الجمهوري    ت: 01-274286/87

ت: 412981 -01 مستشفى حدة الأهلي	

ت: 600000/602008 -01   المستشفى الالماني الحديث 	

فاكس: 418116  	             	

E-mail: felixpene@hotmail.com   

فنادق
فندق فرساي        ت: 2 /425970/1 -01

فنق شيراتون        ت: 237500 -01

فندق موفمبيك       ت: 546666 -01     فاكس: 546000

فندق سبأ       	    ت:272372 -01

فندق ريلاكس ان    ت: 449871 -01

فندق وأجنحة الخليج السياحي 

                         ت:  602135/8 - 602355 -1

ترجمة مكاتب 
الشهاب لخدمات الترجمة:)عربي- إنجليزي()إنجليزي - عربي(

تلفون: 777762202 أو 733008686 - فاكس:01/420657 

sts.yemen@gmail.com :إيميل

هد معا
معهد يالي   ت: 448039-3/4/ 445482  فاكس:448037          

معهد اللغة الألمانيه	    ت: 200945

المعهد البريطاني للغات والكمبيوتر   ت: 266222               

                                      فاكس: 514755    

معهد كاروكوس   ت:    532434/5   فاكس :  532436    

معهدأيكتك      ت: 240833 - 510613   فاكس: 265537

شركات للتأمين
الوطنية للتأمين  ت :272713/272873   فاكس:272924

مأرب للتأمين	             صنعاء ت: 206129/8/13

الشركة اليمنية الإسلامية للتأمين وإعادة التأمين  

	       	 صنعاء ت: 284193،

                                   عدن ت: 244280

		 تعز ت: 258881

شركة اليمن للتأمين     صنعاء ت: 272806/272962/43

  	        عدن ت: 247617

                          تعز ت: 250345

مدارس

روضة واحة الأطفال: تلفاكس:-470250 موبايل: 734522225

مدرسة رينبو                 ت: 414-026/424-433

مدارس صنعاء الدولية      ت: 370191/2    فاكس:370193

مدرسة التركيه الدوليه       ت: 448258/9

مدرسة الماجد اليمنيه       ت: 206159

سفريات j
النسيم للسفريات                   ت:    270750

العالميه للسفريات والسياحه        ت:   44115٨٩/٦٠  

مطاعم
مطعم ومخبازة الشيباني   )باسم محمد عبده الشيباني(

تلفون : 266375 - 505290   فاكس : 267619

 للإشتراك في هذه المساحة الإتصال على

 تحويلة 211  268661 

ك
هم

ت م قا ر ا

لإعلاناتكم
 يرجى التواصل مع قسم

الإعلانات
 والتسويق على رقم
٢٦٨٦٦١/٢/٣

تحويلة ٢٠٢/٢١١

سيارة بيجو406 - موديل 2004 - اللون 

فضي - مجمركة - بحالة جيدة جداً. 

معرض الخالدين - جولة الجامعة الجديدة

السعر: 5000 $

للتواصل: 713116058

سيارة للبيع

كوبون للاعلانات الشخصية المجانية  )كل الاعلانات الشخصية بدون أي مقابل(

❏   بيع       ❏  شراء       ❏  إيجار    ❏  إستئجار   ❏ طلب وظيفة   ❏  وظائف شاغرة       ❏ غير ذلك
تفاصيل الاعلان: ----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

عنوان التواصل: ---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

 قص هذا الكوبون وارسله إلى صحيفة يمن تايمز  على فاكس 268276  او على صندوق بريد  2579 - صنعاء 
لمزيد من المعلومات اتصل ب )ت 268661/2/3(  

للإعلان في هذه الصفحة يرجى الإتصال على الرقم التالي 268661 /01 وإرسال الإعلانات المجانية على فاكس01/268276     
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Yemen’s first and  most widely-read English-language newspaper

Swine Flu and Children 
By Ola Al-Shami

For The Yemen Times 

"To avoid swine 
flu," answered 

Abdulrahman Al-

Khaiwani, 9, when 

asked why he was 

buying face masks from the pharmacy. 

As a cautionary measure, many 

schools postponed this academic year 

due to the H1N1 virus. Families, on the 

other hand, have different points of view, 

degrees of protection, and processes that 

they follow. Children differ in their re-

sponse towards this issue as well.

Swine flu: propaganda, an excuse, 

and advice from elderly women

Safia Al-Saydi, Al-Khaiwani's moth-

er, said: "I think he buys the face mask 

for fun, because he would refuse to put 

on if he was in school." She added that 

he feels happy about the postponing of 

his school, and he enjoys the longer hol-

iday because it means that he can play 

his computer games, which he loves.     

Some parents describe swine flu as an 

infection that attracts a huge amount of 

coverage from the media, which is more 

than it deserves: "I checked the Internet, 

and many physicians sent reports con-

firming that H1N1 can be cured easily. 

The fact is, this is propaganda promoted 

by drug companies," said Noria Abdul-

lah Al-Amrani, a mother of two chil-

dren.

She added that she received many 

emails describing simple ways of curing 

the H1N1 virus, and she no longer feels 

scared.

Some parents however, find it difficult 

to assure their children that the Swine 

Flu is nothing to be afraid of. "We are 

waiting for schools to start and I don't 

know how to stop my children from 

worrying... I don’t want them to use the 

possibility of becoming infected as an 

excuse to not go to school once it be-

gins" commented one student's mother 

Umm Moataz.

Some families are afraid for their chil-

dren in nurseries and primary grades, be-

cause of beliefs that their kids are more 

vulnerable to the H1N1 threat. "In my 

family, we believe that older members 

are more capable of facing the threat of 

H1N1. We care much more about our 

children who are in nurseries, and who 

are younger than twelve years old," said 

Ashwaq Arrabyee, a translator.

Arrabyee said that children can be 

easily infected in school buses or in 

their classes, even if they do not kiss 

each other: "We can recognize the dan-

ger if it's apparent, but children can not. 

If there is someone coughing, we can 

move out of the way, but children can't 

understand how to do this."     

During the past Eid, people with com-

mon sense used face masks, especially 

near parks and other populated areas. 

Al-Saydi said that when she wanted 

to kiss her relatives- as a traditional way 

of welcoming and greeting among Ye-

meni women,  some  would whisper "Do 

you have swine flu?" and then most of 

the visitors would laugh.

Al-Amrani agrees with Al-Saydi, 

and said that during qat sessions all 

the women have no real facts about the 

swine flu, such as how many have died, 

and how many were infected. "The most 

interesting thing I found about the swine 

flu, is that old women have begun to 

give advice about how to be protected, 

but ironically they don't know anything 

about medicine."

Steps for personal protection: Don't 

kiss, wear a face mask, stay far from 

each other

In addition to the official delay of the 

school year in Sana'a and Sayoon after 

the announcement by the Ministry of 

Health as a means of reducing any pos-

sible spread of the disease, TV programs 

deliver advice like, don't kiss, put on a 

face mask in crowed places, and stay far 

away from other people. Parents have 

different methods of protecting them-

selves and their children from H1N1.

Al-Saydi said she tries to tell Abdul-

rahman to not kiss any of his friends: 

"I tell him that, but he always forgets 

what I tell him the moment he sees [his 

friends]." She added that her son has 

many face masks and if school starts he 

will have to wear it at least on the school 

bus, because it's usually crowded. 

Al-Amrani condemned the way 

people tend to believe everything they 

hear, saying "Why don't we try herbal 

remedies, or like the normal flu, try to 

protect ourselves through getting warm-

er and avoiding cold things because it's 

winter?" She added that many people 

get the flu during winter, but the H1N1 

paranoia is going to kill them.

Umm Moataz said that during Rama-

dan when she went to the doctor for a 

check up, people were whispering about 

the presence of an infected patient at the 

doctor's office, and everyone put on a 

face mask. Since then, she believes that 

prevention is the best cure. 


